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Rules for Printing & Publishing Law to 
be completed within 60 days

Yangon, 9 March — 
The Ministry of Informa-
tion is set to complete the 
rules and regulations for 
the Printing and Publishing 
law within 60 days, accord-
ing to U Aung Kyaw Oo, 
Director of the Information 
and Public Relations De-
partment.

Speaking at a press 
conference on Sunday, he 
said the Ministry of Infor-
mation iscooperating with 
the temporary Myanmar 
Press Council and other 
industry bodies to meet the 
deadline.

Meanwhile, the rules 
of the Media Law will be 
written by the Myanmar 
Press Council in coordi-
nation with the Ministry 

of Information, U Aung 
Kyaw Oo said.

The Ministry of In-
formation will submit the 
rules to the Union Govern-
ment for approval. 

About half of the 
Public Service Media Bill 
which was put forward to 
the parliament’s Bill Com-
mittee in May, 2013, has 
been discussed with the 
Bill Committee, an official 
of the ministry said at the 
press conference. 

Regarding the trans-
formation of the analogue 
system to the DVBT-2 
digital system, U Win Kyi, 
Director of Myanmar Ra-
dio and Television, said the 
ministry would transform 
its entire analog system 

to the DVBT-2 system by 
2020. 

The ministry has 
three new channels using 
DVBT-2 digital system  
in Nay Pyi Taw, Yangon 
and Mandalay.  

The Ministry of In-
formation has already 
arranged for delivering 
304,944 Set Top Boxes to 
local citizens which will be 
in the digital broadcasting 
system free of charge, U 
Win Kyi said. 

So far, the ministry has 
already handed out 32,237 
Set Top Boxes to people 
free of charge and is plan-
ning to deliver 108,105 Set 
Top Boxes free of charge to 
the areas in March, he add-
ed.—MNA

Malaysia says 
four passengers 
on missing 
jet used fake 
passports

Suicide 
bomber kills 32 
in Iraqi city of 
Hilla

Syria 
government 
forces take 
village near 
Lebanese border

Page-3

Page-3

Page-4

Purified 
water supply 
arranged for 
Meiktila

Nationwide 
census-taking 
process 
explained in 
Rakhine

Shwe Saryan 
Pagoda Festival 
on 8-16 March

Page-9

Page-2

Page-2

Magway, 9 March— 
An HIV-positive man from 
Mandalay has launched an 
awareness campaign to 
fight against AIDS by rid-
ing his bicycle around My-
anmar to give talks.

Speaking to locals in 
Magway on Saturday, Ko 
Srako said “I was diag-
nosed with HIV in 2005 
and given ART treatment 
one year later. I would 
like to give support to oth-
er HIV positive people, 

HIV-positive man cycles across 
Myanmar to raise AIDS awareness

and suggest ways of living 
a bearable life and taking 
drugs.”

He stopped at 70 plac-
es before reaching Magway 
after cycling a 2,665-mile 
long campaign route. Fol-
lowing his talks in Magway, 
he headed to Ahtat Minhla 
township in the same region 
to continue raising aware-
ness.

“I would like to tell 
their parents, relatives and 
friends that their supports 

benefits HIV-positive peo-
ple and that they should not 
be isolated from the com-
munity. My solo campaign 
is aimed at sharing my ex-
periences through round-
table discussions or talks 
in the towns and villag-
es”, the 35-year-old said. 
He began his campaign 
on 1 December, 2013  
in Yangon and said he 
would continue for an-
other year.—Thura Tun 
(Magway)

Mawlamyine, 9 
March—Vice-President Dr 
Sai Mauk Kham made an 
inspection tour to Maw-

Vice-President Dr Sai Mauk Kham visits 
Mawlamyine, Mon State

lamyine Township of Mon 
State on Sunday.

The Vice-President 
and party met with the 

faculty members of Maw-
lamyine University, Maw-
lamyine Technological 
University and Mawlamy-
ine Education College at 
the hall of Mawlamyine 
University.

In his speech on the 
occasion, the Vice-Presi-
dent said that children are 
our future and after com-
pleting their education 
they will shape the future 
of their nations. Teachers 
have a big responsibility 
as they have to ensure that  
the students will turn into 

good citizens.
The Vice-President 

pointed out the weaknesses 
of basic and tertiary educa-
tion, saying that the stand-
ard of education cannot be 
improved in Myanmar as 
long as the education de-
partments concerned are 
working under the old sys-
tem. 

Although workshops 
on education reforms have 
been organized since  the 
previous year, quick results 
are   impossible,   but   that 

(See page 8)

Vice-President Dr Sai Mauk Kham comforting a patient at Mawlamyine General Hospital.—mna
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Thandwe, 9 March—
The country’s first census 
in three decades was top 
on the agenda at a meeting 
in Thandwe, Rakhine State 
on 5 March, with Deputy 
Minister for Immigration 
and Population U Win My-
int urging the population 
not to be “anxious” as the 
process would not involve 
any forms of “discrimina-
tion.”The deputy minister 
stressed that the process 
includes all races and reli-
gions and that it will only 
be successful if the public 

Purified water supply arranged 
for Meiktila

Meiktila, 9 March—
ATT Co. will in future 
supply Meiktila residents 
with clean water, follow-
ing the announcement the 
company won a bid to pu-
rify water from Meiktila 
Lake through a water treat-
ment system costing of K 
923 million. 

The company has 
started construction of a 
water treatment plant in 

Linzin Ward in Meikti-
la. The plant will distrib-
ute 1.2 million gallons of 
water to the dwellers on a 
daily basis. 

Another water treat-
ment plant will be con-
structed in Paukchaung 
Ward and is expected to 
supply 600,000 gallons of 
water per day.

Linzin and Pauk-
chaung water treatment 

plants will supply the res-
idents of Tanar Manaung, 
Aungzeyar, Zeashaepyin, 
Myomalay, Yanmyoau-
ng, Thirimingala, Pauk-
chaung, Nandawgon and 
Aungsan Wards using wa-
ter tanks. 

The construction of 
the water treatment plants 
is expected to be complet-
ed by late June.

NLM-018

Soe Electric donates 
transformer to Py-

inmana Sangha Hospital

A newly built 6-storey 

Sangha Hospital in Min-

galar Ward, Pyinmana, 

got 500-HVA transformer 

donated by Soe Electric 
and Machinery Co., Ltd. 
on 8 March. The con-
struction of the hospital is 
nearing completion.

Ko Gyi Kyaw

Kyaukse, 9 March—U 
Tin Maung and Daw Tin 
Shwe of Zarmani fami-
ly contributed 10 million 
kyat for providing treat-
ment to patients with eye 
complaint. From 11 to 28 
February this year, eye spe-
cialists for Mandalay, Sin-
gaing and Kyaukse made 
a checkup on patients and 
from 3 to 5 the same year, 
they gave treatment to pa-
tients. During the three 
days, 612 patients were 
given treatment and the re-
maining patients would be 
treated on 10 March. Alto-
gether 887 patients would 
be cured.

Tun Tun Naing 
(Kyaukse)

Nationwide census-taking 
process explained in 
Rakhine

cooperates.
The national census 

will be taken for 12 days 
from 30th March through 
10th April, with preliminary 
results expected in early 
2015.

Thandwe District 
IPRD

People with eye complaint get new Light

Nay Pyi Taw, 9 March 
—The second Regional 
Asian Elephant Veterinary 
Workshop organized by 
Asian Elephant Support 
and US Fish and Wildlife 
was opened on 7 March at 
Nay Pyi Taw Veterinary 
University. 

The first of its kind 
took place in Arche of In-
donesia in 2012. The work-
shop will be held from 7 to 
11 March. 

Second Regional Asian Elephant 
Veterinary Workshop

After the workshop 
on 11 March, a field trip is 
arranged to observe Taung-

gyi Timber Extraction Area 
in Shan State.

NLM

Photo shows water treatment plant under construction in Meiktila. 

Deputy Minister  
U Win Myint makes 

a speech at the 
meeting with officials 

and townselders in 
Thandwe Township in 

Rakhine State. 

Nay Pyi Taw, 9 
March—Two people, in-
cluding one police official, 
were injured on 7 March, 
when villagers in Yinma-
bin Township in Sagaing 
Region staged a protest 
over grabbed land. As bull-
dozers near Pathein-Mony-
wa Motor Road in Ohn-
tonbin Village continued 
their construction work on 
the planned town of Aung-
zeya Myothit, around 30 
villagers attacked police 
and security personnel. 
Clashes between the two 
sides erupted, with police 

Farmers in Yinmabin Township stage 
protest over grabbed land

detaining the leader iden-
tified as 40-year old Kyaw 
Min, and four other pro-
testers including a monk.

According to local 
authorities, houses will be 
built on around 295 land 
plots on 142.78 acres of 
farmland, with remaining 
land plots used for police 
battalions. 

More than a dozen 
villagers had complained 
to local authorities about 
their land having been 
confiscated and demanded 
for the issue to be settled. 
According to the deputy 

commissioner of Yinma-
bin District, the villagers 
were compensated with 
land plots and cash on 12 
February 2014.

Locals have however 
said that they did not re-
ceive adequate compensa-
tion.

Under the supervision 
of Sagaing Region gov-
ernment, local officials re-
turned 284 land plots out 
of 295 acres of farmland 
to the villagers through a 
lucky draw on 2 March 
2014.

MNA
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Italian experts 
highlight China’s 
effort for more 

balanced growth
Rome, 9 March — Chi-

na’s growth target of 7.5 
percent for 2014 that was 
written in the government’s 
work report delivered at the 
parliament’s annual ses-
sion this week was seen by 
Italian economists as an in-
dicator of China’s effort to 
pursue a high-quality and 
more balanced growth.

China doesn’t want 
over high growth rates 
from an “old development 
model” that “does not suit 
the country anymore,” Gi-
uliano Noci, a marketing 
professor and China expert 
at Politecnico di Milano, 
told Xinhua, while com-
menting on the new target 
figure.

The Chinese economy, 
which is both an extraor-
dinary target market and 
an important workshop 
for the international com-
munity, needs to expand 
at a reasonable but more 
high-quality pace, Noci 
explained. Noci said that 
in the current times of eco-
nomic globalization, China 
faces important challenges 
and complex problems in 
pushing forward economic 
and social development.

“If China is able to en-
act the reforms, especially 
focusing on the policies of 
investment liberalization 
and innovation processes, 
the impact on the interna-
tional community will be 
positive,” he went on.

Noci also found Chi-
na’s plan to overhaul the 
current system for local 
governments to contain 
the mounting debt prob-
lem “very positive”. An-
other important aspect, he 
said, is development of 
mixed-ownership economy 
and measures to cut over-
capacity, a major drag on 
the Chinese economy.

Xinhua

Italian PM Renzi to come 
out swinging with  

reform-minded agenda
Rome, 9 March — 

The Matteo Renzi era in 
Italian politics is set to get 
started next week, when 
the reform-minded former 
Florence mayor who on 
22 February became Ita-
ly’s youngest prime min-
ister ever gets started on 
his much-heralded reform 
agenda.

The 39-year-old Ren-
zi said this week he would 
present a series of what he 
called “very important re-
forms” starting the week 
of 10 March, aimed at 
sparking economic growth, 
creating jobs, reforming a 
bloated public administra-
tion, improving outdated 
schools, and making hous-
ing more affordable.

“On Wednesday (12 
March) we will introduce 
an affordable housing 
plan,” Renzi said at a sum-
mit of Italian mayors in 

Sicily. “We also hope for 
measures to be taken on a 
jobs bill.”

Renzi noted that the 
government would spend 
at least 1.7 billion euros 
(2.359 billion US dollars) 
to help combat youth un-
employment, now standing 
at above 40 percent of the 
country’s entire work force 
under the age of 30. Anoth-
er 2 billion euros would be 
spent to update crumbling 
school infrastructure.

Analysts differ on how 
effective Renzi is likely to 
be in his first major effort 
to push an agenda through 
Italy’s notoriously diffi-
cult parliament. But they 
are almost unanimous that 
he is making a serious at-
tempt to confront some of 
the country’s most endem-
ic problems right out of the 
gate.

Xinhua

Malaysia says four passengers on missing jet used fake passports

A spokesman (C) of Malaysia Airlines is surrounded by journalists as he gives a 
briefing about Malaysia Airlines flight MH370, at a hotel in Beijing on 8 March, 

2014.—Reuters

for a missing Malaysian 
Airlines jet with 239 peo-
ple onboard continued for 

the second day on Sunday, 
Malaysian authorities said 
four passengers used sto-

N Korea holds parliamentary election, 1st time under current leader
Pyongyang/Beijing, 

9 March — North Korea 
on Sunday held a nation-
wide election for its rub-
ber-stamp parliament, the 
first since leader Kim Jong 
Un inherited power from 
his father about two years 
ago. The election is merely 
ceremonial, with complete 
support for the single can-
didate running in each con-
stituency most likely to be 
seen again. As of 2 p.m., 
voter turnout had already 
reached 90.91 percent, ac-
cording to North Korea’s 
state media.

Still, the election for 
the 13th Supreme People’s 
Assembly will be closely 
watched by outside observ-
ers as its outcome may pro-
vide a rare glimpse of any 
shift in North Korea’s very 
closed elite structure.

Following the election, 
North Korea is expected to 
partly reshuffle its top offi-
cials.

North Korean citizens 
over 17 years old are en-
titled to participate in the 
election and they are given 
the choice of whether to 
approve or disapprove the 

single candidate in their 
areas. 

Voting, which start-
ed at 9 a.m., was held in a 
festival atmosphere, with 
many women putting on 
colorful traditional clothes 
and citizens holding danc-
ing events. The election is 
likely to help Kim further 
consolidate his rule. 

The focus is on how 
many current members of 
the assembly will be re-
placed with new and pos-
sibly younger deputies 
after Kim, presumed to be 
31 years old, purged and 

executed his once-power-
ful uncle Jang Song Thaek 
in December on treason 
charges. 

“The current election 
is an important work for 
consolidating the supreme 
power organ,” the official 
Rodong Sinmun said in its 
editorial on Sunday.

It said all the candi-
dates in the election are 
“true revolutionaries and 
ardent patriots who have 
devotedly worked for the 
country” and are “loyal” to 
the leadership of Kim.

The election results 

are likely to be announced 
Monday.

New parliamentarians 
are expected to get togeth-
er for the first time in April 
and before that there may 
be a meeting of the Central 
Committee of the ruling 
Workers’ Party to decide 
on its new executive line-
up and important national 
policies.

Kim also ran in the 
election from the No. 111 
constituency in the area of 
Mt. Paektu, an active vol-
cano near the border with 
China described by North 

Korea as the birthplace of 
his father, who died in De-
cember 2011.

North Korea holds 
a parliamentary election 
every five years. Last time 
in March 2009, all deputies 
registered in each of the 
687 constituencies were 
elected to the assembly, 
with official voter turnout 
at 99.98 percent.

The country’s top leg-
islature basically gives a 
rubber stamp to decisions 
made by the ruling party 
headed by Kim.

Kyodo News

len passports to board the 
flight from Kuala Lumpur 
to Beijing.

Malaysia’s act-
ing Transport Minister 
Hishammuddin Hussein 
told reporters on Sunday 
that four passengers used 
stolen European passports 
to board the Boeing 777 
flight, including an Austri-
an and an Italian passport 
that were stolen in Thai-
land.

Hishammuddin said 
international intelligence 
agencies, including the 
US Federal Bureau of  
Investigation, are helping 
Malaysian authorities to 
look into the matter. Apart 
from the four passengers 
using stolen passports, 
Hishammuddin said Ma-
laysian intelligence au-
thorities are screening the 
entire passenger list.

“We are looking at all 
possibilities,” he said.

Hishammuddin also 
said there was no telltale 
debris in the vicinity of an 
oil slick Vietnamese air-
craft spotted Saturday in 
waters near the area where 
Flight MH370 was last de-
tected on the radar.

“We have not been 
able to locate or see any-
thing,” Malaysia’s Civil 
Aviation chief Azaharud-
din Abdul Rahman told re-
porters earlier Sunday.

For the second day, 
aircraft and vessels from 
Malaysia, Singapore, Vi-
etnam, China, the United 
States and the Philippines 
are scouring the South Chi-
na Sea for signs of the Boe-
ing 777-200 aircraft after it 
was last heard from at 1:30 
am.

Kyodo News

Sepang, (Malaysia), 
9 March — As an interna-
tional air-and-sea search 

Suicide bomber kills 32 in Iraqi 
city of Hilla

People gather at the site of a car bomb attack in the 
neighbourhood of al-Qahera in northern Baghdad, on 

9 March, 2014.—Reuters

Hilia, (Iraq), 9 March 
— A suicide bomber driv-
ing a minibus packed with 
explosives killed at least 32 
people and wounded 147 
on Sunday in the southern 
Iraqi city of Hilla, police 
and medical sources said.

The attacker ap-
proached a main check-
point at a northern entrance 
to the largely Shi’ite Mus-
lim city and detonated the 
minibus, a police officer 
said on condition of ano-
nymity.

At least 50 cars were 
set ablaze with passengers 
trapped inside and part of 
the checkpoint complex 
was destroyed, the officer 
said.

It was not immediately 
clear who was behind the 
attack, but suicide bomb-
ings are a trademark of al 
Qaeda-affiliated groups.

“I was sitting inside 
my kiosk when suddenly 
a horrible blast threw me 

outside and hurled my gro-
ceries up in the air. I saw 
cars set ablaze with people 
burning inside,” said Abu 
Nawar, owner of a make-
shift kiosk made of palm 
tree leaves near the check-
point.

Police were using cut-
ting equipment to break in-
side the burnt vehicles and 
lift out charred bodies, the 
police officer said, adding 

the death toll was expected 
to rise.

“When a policeman 
suspected the minibus, he 
asked the driver to pull 
over for a check, but the ve-
hicle exploded,” the police 
officer said.

Bombings and other 
attacks killed almost 8,000 
civilians in 2013, the worst 
period for the country since 
2008.—Reuters
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Young English widower helps in 
Philippines typhoon rebuilding

Leyte, 9 March — For 
recently bereaved British 
widower James Thomp-
son, working as a vol-
unteer in the Philippines 
to help it recover from a 
devastating typhoon is his 
way of honouring his dead 
wife’s memory.

On a recent Saturday, 
Thompson, a 28-year-old 
bricklayer, was carry-
ing concrete blocks to a 
housing construction site 
in Tanauan, a town in 
Leyte, the central Philip-
pine province that bore the 
brunt of last November’s 
Typhoon Haiyan.

“I’m here personally 
because of my wife,” said 
Thompson, a native of 
Long Wittenham in Eng-
land’s Oxfordshire, who 
is taking part in activities 

under the International 
Disaster Volunteers um-
brella.

“Before she died in 
December, she was try-
ing to raise money, about 
200 pounds, for the IDV 
to help the victims in the 
Philippines,” Thompson 
told Kyodo News, speak-
ing less than three months 
since his wife, Helen, 
a teacher, passed away 
from a stroke. They had 
only been married for four 
months.

“It was sad,” an emo-
tional Thompson said. 
“But after she died, she 
actually managed to raise 
about 30,000 pounds as of 
now. So, that’s why I’m 
here now, to work in her 
memory.”

Kyodo News

Libya threatens to 
bomb N-Korean 

tanker if it ships oil 
from rebel port

Tripoli, 9 March —  
Libya threatened on Satur-
day to bomb a North Kore-
an-flagged tanker if it tried 
to ship oil from a rebel-con-
trolled port, in a major esca-
lation of a standoff over the 
country’s petroleum wealth.

The rebels, who have 
seized three major Libyan 
ports since August to press 
their demands for more 
autonomy, warned Tripo-
li against staging an attack 
to halt the oil sale after the 
tanker docked at Es Sider 
terminal, one of the coun-
try’s biggest. The vessel 
started loading crude late at 
night, oil officials said.

Reuters

Photo taken on 8 March, 2014 shows the scene where a PA-44 trainer plane 
crashed in a farmland in Haiyun Village of Chongyi Township in Dujiangyan, 
southwest China’s Sichuan Province. The trainer plane, which crashed here at 

around 3:25 pm on Saturday, was supposed to belong to the Civil Aviation Flight 
University of China. The accident killed two crew members aboard the plane while 

they were in a flight training. The cause of the accident is under investigation. 
Xinhua

Assad says 
reconstruction a 
greater challenge 
in post-crisis era

Damascus, 9 March— 
Syrian President Bashar 
al-Assad said on Saturday 
that post-crisis challenges, 
with reconstruction topping 
its agenda, are more serious 
than the current challeng-
es, according to the official 
SANA news agency.

Noting that the current 
challenges of the Syrian 
crisis are mainly radicalism 
and the presence of traitors, 
al-Assad said that finding 
suitable mechanisms of di-
alogue, fighting corruption 
and reconstruction are need-
ed for the upcoming stage.

The reconstruction pro-
cess is the most challenging 
factor for the next stage, he 
said, however, adding that 
the process will offer a great 
opportunity to reorganize 
the areas that have been 
damaged during the crisis, 
which would give the own-
ers of the damaged prop-
erties a chance to improve 
their financial situation in 
addition to stimulating in-
vestment and creating job 
opportunities, according to 
SANA.—Xinhua

Syria government forces take village near Lebanese border
Beirut, 9 March—  

Syrian government forc-
es seized a village in the 
central Homs Province on 
Saturday, state media and 
a monitoring group said, as 
part of a push for control of 
areas along the Lebanese 
border.

The village of al-Zara, 
west of the city of Homs, 
fell after “heavy clash-
es” between government 
and rebel forces, the Brit-
ain-based Syrian Obser-
vatory for Human Rights 
said, although the number 
of casualties was not im-
mediately clear.

Al-Zara is inhabited 
mostly by Sunni Muslims 
from the ethnic Turkmen 
minority, it added.

In a statement on state 
news agency SANA, Syr-
ia’s armed forces said they 
had established complete 
control over the village and 
killed and captured a “large 
number of terrorists”, us-
ing state media’s custom-
ary term for rebels fight-
ing to overthrow President 
Bashar al-Assad.

The victory gave  
A general view of damaged buildings are seen in the besieged area of Homs  

on 3 March, 2014.—Reuters

Israel brings arms ship to dock, hopes to shame Iran
Eilat, 9 March — A 

ship seized by the Israe-
li Navy on suspicion of 
smuggling arms from Iran 
to the Gaza Strip docked on 
Saturday in Israel, which 
planned to put the cargo on 
display in hope of denting 
Teheran’s rapprochement 
with the West.

The Klos C was taken 
without resistance in the 
Red Sea on Wednesday. 
Israel said it found dozens 
of advanced Syrian-made 
rockets hidden on board in 

An Israeli Navy boat escorts the Panamanian-flagged 
cargo vessel Klos C into the Israeli port of Eilat on 

Saturday 8 March, 2014 after seizing it in the Red Sea 
on Wednesday.—Reuters

Iran and destined for the 
ship’s next port in Sudan, 
from where they would 
have been trucked through 
Egypt to Gaza.

Iran and Gaza’s Isla-
mist Hamas rulers, both 
hostile to the Jewish state, 
rejected the Israeli findings 
as fabrications.

Israeli Prime Minister 
Benjamin Netanyahu, who 
has been dismayed at world 
powers’ nuclear diploma-
cy with Iran since Tehe-
ran installed the relatively  

pragmatic Hassan Rou-
hani as president last year, 
voiced hope they would 
now rethink the outreach.

“This ship will get to 
Eilat and the truth will be-
come fully known,” Netan-
yahu told Israel’s Channel 
10 TV on Friday. “This is 
the real face of Iran.”

The Israeli mili-
tary said it would take 
around two days to find 
and bring out for public 
viewing the contraband 
from the some 150 cargo  

containers abroad the Pana-
manian-flagged Klos C.

The ship would then 
be free to leave, as would 
its 17 crew members, who 
include Turks, Indians, 
Georgians and Azeris.

“They are on the ship. 
They will remain with the 
ship. Given that they have 
no hand in the arms smug-
gling, they will continue 
on their way,” Israeli Ad-
miral Oded Gur-Lavi told  
Reuters.

Reuters

government forces control 
over a route connecting 
central Syria to the Medi-
terranean coast and which 
had been used as “a prima-
ry route for terrorist groups 
coming from Lebanese ter-
ritory to neighboring areas 
to carry out criminal oper-
ations”, it said.

Syria’s civil war has 
killed over 140,000 people 
since it started three years 
ago as a peaceful protest 
movement against four 
decades of Assad family 
rule. The conflict has be-
come increasingly tangled 
as rebel groups — includ-
ing many hardline Islamist 
factions — have turned 
on one another, leading 
to clashes that have killed 
thousands of people this 
year alone. Separately, a 
video was published online 
by activists purportedly 
showing members of the 
al-Qaeda splinter group the 
Islamic State of Iraq and 
the Levant (ISIL) execut-
ing eight prisoners.

In the video, fight-
ers in fatigues line up the  
prisoners inside a building 

and force them to kneel 
before shooting them from 
behind.

Some of the men in the 
video speak Russian with 
marked Caucasian accents 
and speech patterns. To-
ward the end, one speaker 
is heard to say “kill them, 
brothers”. Many foreign 
Islamists have joined the 
fight against Assad, large-

ly from Arab countries but 
also from Russia’s North 
Caucasus region as well 
as Europe, North Ameri-
ca and Asia. It is not clear 
when the video was taken 
or where. Syrian state me-
dia also broadcast the foot-
age, which it was not possi-
ble to verify independently. 
Activists said the fighters  
belonged to ISIL, but that 

was also impossible to ver-
ify.

ISIL is a rebranding 
of al-Qaeda’s affiliate in 
neighboring Iraq but al 
Qaeda’s central leadership 
formally announced a split 
with the group in February 
after disputes over its refus-
al to limit itself to fighting 
in Iraq rather than Syria.

Reuters
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Athens, 9 March — 
Greece and Europe will 
emerge stronger from the 
current economic crisis, a 
confident European Com-
mission President Jose Ma-
nuel Barroso said on Satur-
day.

The EU leader was ad-
dressing 800 participants at 
the 6th European Summit 

Tokyo, 9 March—In 
response to a request from 
the governor of Fukush-
ima, the government has 
agreed to exclude one of 
three towns from its plan 
for building sites to store 
radioactive waste result-
ing from the Fukushima 
Daiichi nuclear plant dis-
aster, sources close to the 
matter said on Saturday.

Disagreement be-
tween the central gov-
ernment and the munic-
ipalities in Fukushima 
Prefecture over the waste 
facilities has been blamed 
for obstructing progress 
in decontaminating areas 
around the nuclear plant 
crippled by the March 
2011 quake and tsunami.

On a visit on Satur-
day to Fukushima, Prime 
Minister Shinzo Abe said 
the government will accel-
erate efforts to construct 
storage facilities which 
are “extremely important 
to promote decontamina-
tion.” 

Abe did not elaborate 
about the plan to build 
storage facilities which the 
government aims to start 
operating in January 2015.

But according to the 
sources, the government 
told local officials that it 
accepts the request made 
by Fukushima Gov Yohei 
Sato in mid-February to 
exclude one of three towns 
near the disaster-struck 
power plant picked as sites 
for the storage facilities.

The Fukushima gov-
ernor asked the govern-
ment to exclude Naraha 
from the plan which also 
included the towns of 
Okuma and Futaba as sites 
for the radioactive waste 
storage facilities.

Kyodo News

Five members of the 12th National Committee of the Chinese People’s Political 
Consultative Conference (CPPCC) give a Press conference on culture, education, 

employment, social security, healthcare and environment protection during the 
second session of the 12th CPPCC National Committee in Beijing, capital of  

China, on 9 March, 2014.—Xinhua

Berlin, 9 March — European Energy Commissioner 
Guenther Oettinger does not expect Russia to switch off 
gas supplies to Europe over the Ukraine crisis, he told 
German magazine Wirtschaftswoche in an interview 
published on Saturday.

“I don’t believe it would be in Russia’s interests,” 
Oettinger was quoted as saying.

Russian gas export giant Gazprom issued a thinly 
veiled warning on Friday that it could stop shipping 
gas to Ukraine over unpaid bills. Ukraine is a major gas 
transit nation for supplies from Russia to the European 
Union, which relies on Russia for about a quarter of its 
gas. But Oettinger said a cut-off would not be beneficial 
for the company: “Gazprom has an interest in its daily 
sales revenues so that investment is worthwhile and 
turnover is generated.”

Oettinger said if no more gas flowed through 
Ukraine, it would affect 14 percent of European gas 
consumption.

In early 2009 Gazprom cut off gas to Ukraine over 
unpaid bills, leading to reductions in European supplies 
during a cold winter.

But Oettinger said Europe was better placed to deal 
with such a scenario given that the winter had been mild, 
gas storage sites were fuller than a year ago and Europe-
an Union countries were now obliged to ensure they had 
30 days’ worth of supplies. “We’re in a better position 
than we were five years ago,” he said.—Reuters

Obama calls six world leaders on Ukraine crisis
Washington, 9 March — US President Barack Oba-

ma called six world leaders on Saturday to discuss the 
ongoing crisis in Ukraine, the White House said.

Obama spoke separately with British Prime Minister 
David Cameron, French President Francois Hollande and 
Italian Prime Minister Matteo Renzi about Ukraine, ac-
cording to a readout from the White House.

Obama welcomed the “strong, unified” stance of the 
United States and the European Union on Russian actions 
in Ukraine, including the conclusions of the European 
Council.

The European Union on Thursday decided to con-
duct targeted measures against Russia as a result of the 
Ukraine crisis, calling for solution to the crisis through 
negotiations between Ukraine and Russia.

Obama, who is on a weekend vacation with his fam-
ily in Florida, also held a conference call with the presi-
dents of Lithuania, Latvia and Estonia. He reaffirmed the 
United States’ “unwavering commitment” to its collec-

tive defence commitments under the North Atlantic Trea-
ty and “enduring support for the security and democracy” 
of the Baltic countries.

It was the first time Obama has spoken with the lead-
ers of the three Baltic states about the crisis. The three 
countries are NATO members with strong economic ties 
to Russia.

US Defence Secretary Chuck Hagel said on Wednes-
day that the US plans to expand military cooperation with 
Poland and Baltic states to show “support” for its allies 
amid crisis in Ukraine.

The US has accused Russia of “violating” Ukraine’s 
sovereignty and territorial integrity as well the interna-
tional law by its military intervention in Crimea, while 
calling for withdrawing its troops and starting talks with 
Ukrainian interim government to find a diplomatic solu-
tion. Washington has also imposed visa bans and finan-
cial sanctions on a number of Ukrainians and Russians it 
claims responsible for the crisis.—Xinhua 

Greece, Europe to emerge stronger from crisis

European Energy Commissioner Guenther Oettinger 
addresses a news conference on the security of energy 
supply and international cooperation at the EU Com-

mission headquarters, in Brussels on 7 Sept, 2011.
Reuters

Russia won’t switch off gas supply to 
Europe

Ex-guerrilla favourite to win El Salvador’s presidential election
San Salvador, 9 

March — A former Marx-
ist guerrilla leader is ex-
pected to win El Salvador’s 
presidency on Sunday after 
promising to expand social 
programmes for the poor 
and fending off his oppo-
nent’s claims that he will 
impose radical policies.

Recent polls showed 
Salvador Sanchez Ceren of 
the leftist Farabundo Marti 
National Liberation Front 
(FMLN), the rebel group in 
the country’s 1980-92 civil 
war, with about 55 percent 
support heading into the 
second round run-off vote 
on Sunday.

One of the wartime 

leaders of the FMLN, 
Sanchez Ceren faces con-
servative rival Norman 
Quijano, the former mayor 
of the capital, San Salva-
dor, who trailed in polls 
with about 45 percent.

A victory for Sanchez 
Ceren would give the 
FMLN a second consecu-
tive term and the affable, 
media-shy 69-year-old has 
vowed to build on its so-
cial programmes, which 
include a glass of milk a 
day for children and free 
school uniforms, shoes and 
supplies.

Quijano has tried to 
paint Sanchez Ceren as a 
communist radical with 

blood on his hands but in 
a country where one-third 
of people live in poverty 
and many rely on money 

sent home from relatives 
living in the United States, 
the FMLN’s social pro-
grammes are popular.

“No other government 
has done these things,” said 
Beatriz Herrera, a 43-year-
old fruit seller in Santa 
Ana, El Salvador’s sec-
ond-biggest city, around 40 
miles northwest of the cap-
ital. “The FMLN really got 
to work to help those of us 
who are poor,” she said in 
the shade of a gnarled tree 
beside a spring-fed pub-
lic swimming pool where 
youths swam and played.

Santa Ana, founded by 
coffee barons who built a 
brilliant white cathedral in 
the city centre, had long 
been a power center of the 
country’s powerful right-
wing.—Reuters

Salvador Sanchez Ceren, presidential candidate for 
the Farabundo Marti Front for National Liberation 
(FMLN), speaks to his supporters after the official 
results in San Salvador on 3 Feb, 2014.—Reuters

Gov’t partially 
accepts local 
request on 

radioactive waste 
plan

of Regions and Cities host-
ed in Athens with focus on 
“European recovery and lo-
cal solutions.”

Members of the EU 
Committee of the regions, 
and of national, region-
al and local parliaments 
and councils, stakeholders 
from the Greek civil so-
ciety, representatives of  

associations and experts 
from the EU institutions 
took part in the two-day 
event which closed on Sat-
urday noon.

The aim was to take 
stock of the efforts made at 
all levels to deliver recov-
ery and to debate the EU’s 
growth and jobs strategy, 
the challenges the EU faces 

and its future ahead of the 
elections for the European 
Parliament in May, as well 
as the key role of regional 
authorities in this course. “I 
am confident that Europe 
can emerge from the crisis 
not only stronger, but also 
more united and open,” 
Barroso stressed in his key-
note speech.

Referring to the host 
country Greece, he said “I 
am confident about the fu-
ture of Greece,” adding that 
the EU will “stay to support 
Greece, provided of course 
that Greeks are able to stay 
the course of pursuing more 
competitiveness and make 
the reforms to have sustain-
able growth.”—Xinhua
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Japan to cut  
bluefin tuna 

catch in  
Northern  

Pacific by half
Tokyo, 9 March — Ja-

pan plans to slash by half 
the amount of juvenile 
bluefin tuna taken from the 
Northern Pacific starting 
in 2015, compared to the 
2002-2004 average, a Fish-
eries Agency source said 
on Saturday.

The sharp cut may lead 
to a rise in prices of sashimi 
at food stores, but the agen-
cy placed a high priority 
on protecting bluefin tuna 
amid concern about declin-
ing stocks.

The move is also 
aimed at encouraging oth-
er nations to adopt massive 
cuts. Last December an 
international conference 
involving Japan agreed to 
cut each nation’s quota for 
juvenile bluefin tuna, or 
fish aged 3 or younger, in 
2014 by more than 15 per-
cent from the 2002-2004 
average.

But Japanese research-
ers concluded that Japan’s 
goal of raising bluefin tuna 
stocks to about 50,000 tons 
will not be achieved even 
if each country reduces its 
catch quota by 15 to 25 
percent. Stocks of bluefin 
tuna aged 4 or older in the 
Northern Pacific are esti-
mated at 26,000 tons, ac-
cording to the agency.

The agency will ex-
plain the plan at a meeting 
of the government’s wide 
area fisheries coordinating 
committee on Monday.

 Kyodo News

AT&T cuts wireless data charges for individual customers

An At&T logo is seen atop a store in Beverly Hills, California on 31 Aug, 2011.—Reuters

and 50 GB cloud storage. 
Customers with two smart-
phones will now pay $90.

The latest plan fol-
lows price cuts AT&T 
announced last month for 
families and customers 
who share large data plans, 
as well as its offer of a 
$200 credit to customers 
who switch to its network. 
AT&T has been fiercely 
competing with smaller 
rival T-Mobile US after 
T-Mobile spent several 
quarters directly market-
ing to AT&T customers. 
T-Mobile, a long-time in-
dustry straggler, was able 
to report three full quarters 
of customer growth after 
four years of losses.

Separately on Friday, 

Ranbaxy recalls some batches of generic Lipitor in latest 
quality blow

Mumbai, 9 March — 
Indian drugmaker Ranbaxy 
Laboratories Ltd, reeling 
under a flurry of regulatory 
rebukes due to manufactur-
ing quality concerns, has 
recalled more than 64,000 
bottles of the generic ver-
sion of a cholesterol-low-
ering drug in the United 
States after doseage mix-
up was detected.Ranbaxy 
recalled tablets of atorvas-
tatin calcium, the gener-
ic version of Pfizer Inc’s 
cholesterol fighter Lipitor, 
after a pharmacist found 
a 20-milligram tablet in a 
sealed bottle marked for 
10-milligram tablets, the 
US Food and Drug Admin-
istration (FDA) said on its 
website.

Ranbaxy, India’s big-
gest drugmaker by revenue 

Shanghai Exchange gets approval for 
trading platform in free-trade zone

Beijing, 9 March — 
The Shanghai Stock Ex-
change has secured ap-
provals from regulators to 
set up an international trad-
ing centre in the free-trade 
zone, the chairman of the 
bourse said on Saturday. 
The move could pave the 
way for more foreign in-
vestors to tap the world’s 
fourth-largest stock market 
by capitalization and also 
for foreign companies to 
issue shares in the world’s 
second-largest economy.

Gui Minjie, chairman 
of the Shanghai Stock Ex-
change, said significant 
progress has been made in 
recent years allowing Chi-
nese firms to list on over-
seas markets. However, 
no foreign companies are 
allowed to issue shares on 
Chinese bourses. Speaking 

Brokers work next to their computers at the Shanghai 
Stock Exchange on 18 Aug, 2009. — Reuters

New York, 9 March 
— AT&T Inc said on Sat-
urday it is cutting wireless 
data charges for individual 
customers who have no an-
nual service contract, as the 

No 2 US mobile operator 
attempts to better compete 
with rival T-Mobile US 
Inc. Customers having one 
smartphone with no annual 
service contract will now 

pay $65 per month instead 
of $80 for a plan that in-
cludes 2GB LTE wireless 
data, unlimited talk and 
text messaging, unlimited 
international messaging 

T-Mobile said it was dou-
bling to 1GB the amount 
of LTE wireless data it was 
providing with its flagship 
Simple Choice plan, which 
costs $50 a month, and also 
includes unlimited talk and 
domestic and international 
text messaging. AT&T pre-
viously said that T-Mobile’s 
efforts only concerned the 
most cost-conscious custom-
ers, who are not its or market 
leader Verizon Communica-
tions Inc’s primary targets.

All four US wireless 
providers, including Sprint 
Corp, have made price ad-
justments as they attempt 
to sustain growth in a ma-
ture market built on steal-
ing growth from competi-
tors. —Reuters

to reporters at the sidelines 
of the parliament session 
in Beijing, Gui said the 
exchange was preparing a 
team to study ways to de-
velop the trading platform.

China opened the 
Shanghai free-trade zone 
in late September to fuel 
development of the coun-

try’s financial-services sec-
tor. Beijing has said that 
it would allow a trial of a 
fully convertible yuan capi-
tal account in the free-trade 
zone, sparking hopes for an 
easing of controls that bar 
foreign companies from 
raising capital through 
IPOs.—Reuters

JP Morgan Chase’s sale of 
private equity arm stalls
New York, 9 March 

— The auction of JP Mor-
gan Chase’s private equity 
business, One Equity Part-
ners, in the market since at 
least November, has hit an 
impasse, according to three 
people with knowledge of 
the situation.

Two people close to 
potential buyers said the 
bank “pulled” the busi-
ness off the market. An-
other source, active in the 
secondary market but not 
directly involved with the 
process, described the auc-
tion as stalled after the bank 
increased its asking price.

“The bid/ask spread 
has widened dramatically,” 
the secondary professional 
said. “It’s hard to imagine 
someone stretching to that 
level. There’s a lot of dis-
appointed buyers.” Sources 
said the bank could revive 
an auction of One Equity at 
any time.

“The question is, do 
they try and come back 
six months from now, or 
never?” one source said. 
A spokesperson for JP 
Morgan Chase declined to 
comment.

The bank announced 
last July it was spinning off 
One Equity, its last remain-
ing private equity opera-
tion, because the unit was 

not core. JP Morgan Chase 
was not under regulatory 
pressure to sell: One Equi-
ty would not be affected by 
the Dodd-Frank financial 
reform law, which restricts 
the ability of bank holding 
companies to own and op-
erate private equity groups, 
sister news service Reuters 
reported last year. Potential 
buyers were bidding for 
a portfolio of buyout and 
growth equity investments 
valued at more than $4 bil-
lion, according to sources. 

The winning bidder 
was also expected to con-
tribute to a new fund the 
team would raise as an in-
dependent firm. As part of 
the deal, One Equity, which 
has been investing off the 
bank’s balance sheet, want-
ed $1.5 billion to $2 billion 
in funding for new deals, 
Dow Jones reported in No-
vember.

Without a deal in 
place, One Equity team 
would likely have to move 
forward without any new 
capital from the bank. One 
Equity is drawing from 
“outstanding capital com-
mitments” from the bank 
until starting its next fund, 
which would be raised 
from external investors, 
according to One Equity’s 
website.—Reuters

A sign outside the headquarters of JP Morgan Chase & 
Co in New York, on 19 Sept, 2013.—Reuters

and majority owned by Ja-
pan’s Daiichi Sankyo Co 
Ltd, confirmed the recall of 
select batches of the drug, 
but said the company had 
not received any product 
complaints. “Ranbaxy is 
proactively recalling the 
lots out of an abundance of 
caution, keeping the safety 
of its patients in mind and 
with the full knowledge of 
the US FDA,” the company 
said in a statement issued to 
Reuters on Saturday.

The recall is the latest 
in a series of problems to hit 
Ranbaxy, which has had all 
its India factories stopped 
from sending drugs and 
ingredients to the United 
States, its biggest market.
Ranbaxy-owned Ohm Lab-
oratories Inc in New Jersey 
is now the company’s only 

permitted maker of drugs 
for US sale. Worries about 
quality control in India’s 
$14 billion drug industry 
have come to the fore in 
the past year as plants run 
by Ranbaxy and local rival 
Wockhardt Ltd have been 
banned after falling short 
of the FDA’s “good manu-
facturing practices”.

India’s drugmakers 
have come under closer 
scrutiny as the FDA, the 
guardian of the world’s 
most important pharmaceu-
ticals market, has increased 
its presence in the country, 
reflecting India’s growing 
importance as a supplier to 
the United States.

Reuters
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Tencent headquarters is seen at Nanshan Hi-Tech Industrial Park in the southern 
Chinese city of Shenzhen on 9 June, 2011.—Reuters

China’s Tencent may take 16 percent 
stake in JD. com

Shanghai, 9 March 
— China’s largest Internet 
company Tencent Hold-
ings Ltd may soon an-
nounce a deal to take about 
a 16 percent stake in online 
retailer JD.com and merge 
their online shopping plat-
forms, local media reported 
on Saturday.

JD.com, China’s sec-
ond-largest e-commerce 
company, has a nearly 13 
percent market share. Any 
deal between two of Chi-
na’s largest online com-
panies would help narrow 
the huge gap between e-re-
tailers and Alibaba Group 
Holding Ltd, which domi-
nates China’s booming on-
line commerce market.

Under the deal, both 
companies will combine 
their e-commerce business, 
with Tencent transferring 
its less popular e-com-
merce sites, including yix-
un.com, to JD.com, Chi-
na’s major business paper 
Caixin reported, citing uni-
dentified company sources.
Tencent and JD.com were 
not immediately available 
for comment.The firms 
may announce the deal as 
early as Monday, the pa-
per said, adding that the 16 
percent stake was the mini-
mum level being discussed 
and Tencent could raise the 
shareholding in JD.com to 
more than 20 percent.

China’s business-  

to-consumer e-commerce 
sales may surpass $180 bil-
lion this year due to rising 
internet usage, expanding 
middle-class incomes and a 
better distribution network, 
according to New York-
based market research firm 
eMarketer. Tencent, Aliba-
ba and search engine giant 
Baidu Inc are competing to 
cash in on the rising popu-
larity of mobile internet in 
China.

Tencent gets the ma-
jority of its revenue from 
computer games, but its 
mobile games are also 
hugely popular, according 
to figures from domes-
tic app stores. Tencent’s 
WeChat social messaging 

app is also used by more 
than half of all Chinese 
smartphone users. Alib-
aba’s Tmall marketplace 

controls at least half of all 
online retail sales and its 
e-Bay like Taobao controls 
around 80 percent of con-

sumer-to-consumer online 
sales, according to data 
from Euromonitor. 

Reuters

A zoomed illustration image of a man looking at a 
computer monitor showing the logo of Amazon is seen 

in Vienna on 26 Nov, 2012.—Reuters

UK court ruling may prompt more scrutiny of Amazon tax plans

London, 9 March — 
Amazon’s tax affairs could 
come under more scrutiny 
in Britain, tax experts said, 
after a judge questioned 
whether it really was or-
ganized in the tax efficient 
way it said it was.

The ruling comes as 
big technology groups, in-
cluding Amazon, face in-
creasing scrutiny in Britain 
over their tax practices.

A UK judge ruled 
earlier this month that 
Amazon had infringed the 

trademark of soap maker 
Lush by posting advertise-
ments on Google mention-
ing “Lush soap” and by 
offering customers who 
searched for “Lush soap” 
on its own website a list of 
options.

Since Lush products 
were not available on Ama-
zon’s UK website — on the 
manufacturer’s insistence 
— the judge ruled custom-
ers could be confused.

Amazon did not re-
spond to requests for 
comment. Lush said it 
welcomed the ruling. In 
addition to denying in-
fringement, Amazon said 
only its main European op-
erating subsidiary, Luxem-
bourg-based Amazon EU 
Sarl., and not the group’s 
UK subsidiary, Amazon.

co.uk Ltd, should be a de-
fendant. Amazon argued 
Amazon.co.uk Ltd had no 
case to answer because 
Amazon EU Sarl ran the 
UK business from Luxem-
bourg, and that the British 
subsidiary simply provided 
services such as warehous-
ing to the Amazon group.

This structure is also 
the basis of Amazon’s 
claim that its retail business 
doesn’t have a tax resi-
dence in Britain — and that 
therefore, all revenues and 
profits should be declared 
in low-tax Luxembourg. 
But the judge said Ama-
zon’s depiction of the role 
of the UK unit was “wholly 
unreal and divorced from 
the commercial reality of 
the situation”. 

Reuters

US extends Terremark contract as 
HealthCare.gov host

Washington, 9 March 
— The Obama administra-
tion said on Friday Veri-
zon Communications Inc’s 
Terremark unit will remain 
under contract as host of 
the federal website Health-
Care.gov to better ensure a 
smooth end to Obamacare’s 
open enrollment period 
on 31 March. Terremark’s 
contract with the Depart-
ment of Health and Human 
Services was due to expire 
on 30 March, the day before 
the end of open enrollment 
for 2014, a time when high 
daily volumes are expect-
ed as consumers from 36 
states rush to use to website 
to sign up for subsidized 
private health insurance. It 
would be extended for up to 
seven months, according to 
federal documents.

Hewlett-Packard Co 

has been named to replace 
Terremark as website host 
and operator of the depart-
ment’s federal data centre 
as part of Obama’s Patient 
Protection and Affordable 
Care Act. “We extended 
Terremark’s contract term 

Energy industry projects 
bullish future

Houston, 9  March — 
Industry executives attend-
ing the IHS CERAWeek 
energy conference in the 
US city of Houston predict-
ed a bullish future as the 
week-long summit came to 
a close on Friday.

They believe energy 
remains one of the driving 
engines of the world econ-
omy and still has boundless 
potential to tap. Energy 
sources will become more 
diversified in the next few 
decades with the develop-
ment of renewables, but 
fossil fuels would remain 
central to the energy mix.

Energy demand is not 
expected to dwindle in the 
least, instead growing at 
a substantial rate over the 

next 20 years. Develop-
ing countries, particularly 
those in Asia, will be the 
major contributors to that 
growth.A louder call was 
voiced at the summit, one 
of the world’s most influ-
ential gatherings of indus-
try leaders, for the US gov-
ernment to ease the ban on 
crude oil export, as a recent 
shale boom is rapidly lift-
ing the country from a net 
importer to a net exporter. 
Executives argue an open 
market can only benefit 
the already oil-sufficient 
nation economically, polit-
ically and diplomatically. 
But there is no sign yet that 
Washington will loosen its 
grip on its strategic assets 
anytime soon.—Xinhua

A man looks over the Affordable Care Act (commonly 
known as Obamacare) signup page on the HealthCare.

gov website in New York in this 2 Oct, 2013 photo 
 illustration.—Reuters

in order to ensure a suc-
cessful transition between 
the two contractors,” said 
a statement issued by the 
Centers for Medicare and 
Medicaid Services, the 
Obamacare agency at HHS.

Reuters

MasterCard, Visa form group to 
enhance payment security

New York, 9 March 
— Visa Inc and Mas-
terCard Inc, the world’s 
two largest payment net-
works, have formed a new 
cross-industry group to 
improve payment system 
security following a num-
ber of high-profile data 
breaches.

The new group, 
which will include banks, 
credit unions, retailers 
and industry trade groups, 
will initially focus on 
the adoption of the safer 
‘EMV’ chip technology 
in the United States, Mas-
terCard and Visa said on 
Friday.

EMV chip technology, 
already used in Europe and 
Asia, stores information 
on computer chips rather 
than on traditional magnet-
ic strips. EMV stands for 

Europay, MasterCard and 
Visa, the companies that 
launched the technology. 
The move follows sever-
al data breaches at US re-
tailers, including one at 
Target Corp late last year 
involving the theft of about 
40 million credit and debit 
card records.

“We remain insistent 

that US retailers’ customers 
be given the same protec-
tions as consumers in more 
than 80 countries who have 
both a chip and a PIN se-
curing their credit and deb-
it cards,” National Retail 
Federation General Counsel 
Mallory Duncan said in a 
statement.

Reuters
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Proposed law on 
“balancing” population 
raises questions

The government is planning a law to “balance 
the increasing population.” According to of-

ficials the step has been recommended by monks, 
with the proposal already submitted by Presi-
dent U Thein Sein to the Union Parliament. On 
March 7, the government released a notification 
saying that in order to draft the bill a commis-
sion has been formed, including officials from 
the Ministry of Immigration and Population and 
the Ministry of Religious Affairs. The planned 

Write for us
We appreciate your feedback and contributions. If 

you have any comments or would like to submit edito-
rials, analyses or reports please email wallace.tun@
gmail.com with your name and title.

law would “strengthen national unity” and take 
into consideration the existence of the country’s 
“diverse beliefs and religions.”  In that context, 
what does “balancing the increasing population” 
mean and where would the new law be applied?

While several foreign organizations have doc-
umented an enforced two-child policy in Rakhine 
state concerning some communities, the govern-
ment has dismissed the reports as baseless. One 
local journalist, however, said the planned bill 
might reflect some policies of Myanmar’s giant 
neighbour. “It will be just like in China with the 
one-child policy,” he said. Indeed, the notification 
from March 7 stated that the bill would be draft-
ed after “studying the laws of foreign countries 
and analyzing the points acceptable in Myanmar 
society.”

The one-child policy in China, however, ap-
plies to everyone in the country—at least in theo-
ry—and not just to one undesirable group. Forc-
ing one section of society to limit its offspring 

would cause an outcry in the West, it would be 
unthinkable, yet Westerners here turn a blind 
eye to social issues for the sake of profit. Details 
of what the newly founded commission will focus 
on in order to draft the bill, and what the bill is 
really about have not been revealed. The notifi-
cation only states that the commission will take 
into consideration “suggestions from monks, cit-
izens and experts.” Linking religious affairs ex-
perts with “balancing the increasing population” 
seems to point in the direction of west Myanmar.

We’ll know more “no later than 30 June, 
2014…(when) the commission has to present its 
final draft to President U Thein Sein.” And the 
law will come as “the commission’s task is com-
pleted when the draft is enacted a law.”

By Kerstin Winter

Vice-President Dr Sai Mauk 
Kham visits Mawlamyine...

(from page 1)
changes are happening and 
the reforms carried out now 
will see much improvement 
in about 10 to 15 years,  

He continued that eco-
nomic success in Myanmar 
could be achieved in a short 
period of time if Myanmar 
is able to produce graduates 

be privatized and that edu-
cation and health facilities 
would be improved.

Highlighting the ongo-
ing problems with rampant 
corruption, Dr Sai Mauk 
Kham called on the people 
to report cases of corrup-
tion.

On a lighter note, he 
said there are plans to sell 
mobile phones at affordable 
prices.	

The chairmen of 
Township Development 
Supportive Committee and 
locals of Mawlamyine, Be-
lin, Kyaikmaraw, Thanbyu-
zayat, Kyaikto, Chaungzon 
and Ye townships reported 
on regional requirements to 
the Vice-President and the 
Mon State Chief Minister 
made clarifications. 

In the afternoon, the 
Vice-President met with 
the medical superintendant, 
specialists, doctors, nurs-
es and staff of Mawlamy-
ine General Hospital and 

pledged to fulfill the needs 
of the hospital. Then, the 
Vice-President and party 
looked round the wards of 
the hospital.

The Vice-President 
attended the opening of 
CT Scan building of Maw-
lamyine General Hospital. 
The 40 ft long, 35 ft wide 
RC Type CT Scan building 

was built with the fund con-
tributed by the Ministry of 
Health.

In the evening, the 
Vice-President paid hom-
age to the Kyaikhami San-
tawshin Pagoda and donat-
ed flowers, water, light and 
gold foils to the Buddha im-
age and signed the visitors’ 
book. 

Next, he attended the 
cash donation ceremony of 
Myanmar Lighting (IPP) 
Co to Kyonekatat Basic 
Education High School in 
Thanbyuzayat Township.

Later, the Vice-Pres-
ident and party viewed 
round the development of 
tourism industry in Setse 
beach.—MNA

Myanmar SMEs’ entrepreneurs 
leave for Japan

Yangon, 9 March—
Altogether 30 Myanmar 
SMEs’ entrepreneurs 
members of UMFCCI 
left Yangon for Japan 
on 3 March to attend the 
SME’s Competitive Busi-
ness Strategy (ENBS) 
Japan, Training Program 
at  HIDA Tokyo Kenshu 
Center in Tokyo of Japan 
from 5 to 11 March.

They were seen off at 
the Yangon International 
Airport by Vice-President 

Dr U Myo Thet of Union 
of Myanmar Federation of 
Chambers of Commerce 

and Industry-UMFCCI 
and officials.

MNA

Vice-President Dr Sai Mauk Kham offers gold foils to Kyaikhami Santawshin Pagoda in 
Mawlamyine.—mna 

Vice-President Dr Sai Mauk Kham presents 
cash donation to pagoda board of trustees 

of Kyaikhami Santawshin Pagoda in 
Mawlamyine.—mna

he added.
The aim of opening 

technological universities 
in each region and state is to 
enable local youth to have 
access to tertiary education. 
He said out-of-town univer-
sities with no accommoda-
tion facilities are an issue 
that needs to be resolved, 
highlighting the importance 
of building dorms.

He stressed the need 
for an increase of salaries 
for teachers as one of the 
main points.  Adequate sal-
aries are of vital importance 
in fighting against corrup-
tion, he said.

who are proficient in their 
respective subjects. 

At the meeting with 
the local people at the State 
hall, the Vice-President said 
that locals that as part of the 
country’s reforms they are 
allowed to set up unions and 
stage protests.

He said that the reforms 
have also led to the release 
of prisoners of conscience 
and that exiled Myanmar 
citizens can return home.

Regarding the reforms 
of the economic sector, 
Vice-President Dr Sai Mauk 
Kham stressed that some 
state-owned sectors would 
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Shwe Saryan Pagoda Festival 
on 8-16 March

Thaton, 9 March—
Shwe Saryan Pagoda Fes-
tival is being held on 8 to 
16 March at the Pagoda in 
Thaton Township of Mon 
State.

“We placed 106 shops 
with fare prices near the 

pagoda. Swan Zarni Myan-
mar traditional performing 
arts troupe will entertain 
on 13 to 16 March. So, the 
pagoda festival is crowded 
with the devotees,” said a 
member of Pagoda Board 
of Trustees.

The Pagoda will be 
consecrated by the Sayad-
aws and the merit makers 
will donate rice and offer-
tories to 108 monks on 15 
March (the Fullmoon Day 
of Tabaung).

Thet Oo (Thaton)

Lawkamarazein Pagoda, 28 Buddha 
images consecration ceremony held in 

Pyinmana Tsp
Nay Pyi Taw, 9 

March—A ceremo-
ny to consecrate the 
Lawkamarazein Pagoda 
and 28 Buddha images took 
place on 8 March at the pre-
cinct of the Pagoda.

The pagoda is situated 
in Pyinmana Township of 
Nay Pyi Taw Council Area.

Seventh Sayadaws 
from the monasteries of 
Pyinmana Township conse-
crated the pagoda and Bud-
dha images.

At the ceremony, the 
State Ovadaçariya Sayadaw 
Abbot of Zekone Monas-
tery of Pyinmana Township 
delivered a sermon, and the 

congregations shared mer-
its gained.

The 141st festival of 
the Pagoda is being held 
from 8 to 15 March at 
there and the merit mak-
ers will donate rice to 180 
monks at 2 p.m. on 15 
March.
Ko Gyi Kyaw (Pyinmana)

About 3000 eye patients get free medical 
treatment in Myingyan Tsp

Myingyan, 9 
March—The first free 
eye care services to mark 
the 46 anniversary of the 
Myingyan Sayadaw were 
provided at 8 a.m on 
Saturday at the clinic of 
Myingyan Township in 
Mandalay Region.

At the ceremony, the 
disciples took the Eight 

Precepts from the Sayad-
aw. The Sayadaws recited 
Parittas and the merit mak-
ers donated offertories to 
the Sayadaw and monks.

Wellwishers donated 
K 43 million for free eye 
donation through Manda-
lay Region Minister for 
Transport U Kyaw San.

The eye specialists 

from Yangon and My-
ingyan provided health 
care services to 3000 eye 
patients from Myingyan 
and Taungtha townships. 
Of them, over 500 pa-
tients were performed 
operation free of charge 
made by the eye special-
ists.—Zaw Min Naing 
(Myingyan)

CENSUS TAKING SENSE CULTIVATED FOR THANLYIN 
DWELLERS: As the day to take census is drawing near, Immigration 

officers of Thanlyin Township in Yangon Region supervise tasks of 
disseminating knowledge on census taking process. Photo shows stickers 

depicting census process are put on cars for public knowledge on 7 March. 
Tin Maung Ngwe (Thanlyin)

Mohnyin, 9 March 
– According to Mohnyin 
District Deputy Commis-
sioner U Aung Soe Moe, 
17 tasks have been carried 
out for poverty alleviation 
and rural development 
spending 176.85 million 
Kyat in Mohnyin District 
in Kachin State. Among 
these 17  tasks, build-
ing of bridges and lay-
ing pipelines have been 
completed. Officials of 
Township Development 
Affairs Committees are 
now in close supervision 
on the remaining tasks in 
Mohnyin, Mogaung and 
Phakant Townships.

 Kyaw Soe Lay  
(K Hsai Naw-Phakant)

Poverty alleviation drives in Mohnyin

Chin brethrens enjoy IPRD’s BOOK 
CORNERs in Falam, Chin State

Falam, 9 March—
Centering on the people, 
staff of Information and 
Public Relations Depart-
ment in Falam, Chin State, 
are serving the locals by 
establishing Book Corners 
and Mini Book Corners in 
public places. A Book Cor-
ner opened at Shwe Chin-
thae (Golden Lion) Bus 
Stop in PharHtauk Ward in 
the town is one of the ex-
amples broadening the ho-
rizons of people. 

Various kinds of 
books with numerous cate-

gories are kept at the book 
corner. A local expressed 
his opinion that book cor-
ners should be established 
in every bus stop as they 

disseminate knowledge to 
people. Staff of IPRD, for 
their part, provide new ar-
rival of books and period-
icals for the people every 
month.—Min SeinMyawady Tsp FSD carries  

out drill
Myawady, 9 March — 

Myawady Township Fire 
Services Department car-
ried out fire drill at Bayint-
naung Market in Myawady 
on Sunday.  Before the drill, 
officials from the fire servic-
es department gave talks on 
preventive measures against 
fire.  Township Administra-

tor U Thein Zaw Kan de-
livered an opening speech 
and Chairman of Township 
Development Committee 
U Than Shwe and officials 
explained the purpose of 
the drill.The ceremony was 
attended by town’s elders 
and departmental officials. 

Tun Tun Oo

Farmers in Natogyi Tsp earn 
higher income from Aster flower 

Natogyi, 9 March — 
Local farmers in Aungtha 
Village, Natogyi Town-
ship, has earned increasing 
income from cultivation of 
aster flowers.

The florists sell K 300 
for a bunch of colourful 

flowers. The farmers grow 
aster flower in November 
and pluck flowers in Febru-
ary. Aungtha aster flowers 
are also shipped to markets 
in Natogyi, Myingyan and 
Taungtha.—Khin Zar Mon 
Myint (Law)
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East African nations woo European 
tourists with single visa

Nairobi, 9 March — 
Kenya, Rwanda and Ugan-
da are jointly wooing Eu-
ropean tourists with their 
newly introduced single 
visa which took effect in 
January.

The three countries 
which are part of the 
five-member East Africa 
Community (EAC) bloc 
presented their joint single 
tourist visa to the world 
during the ongoing Inter-
national Tourism Bourse 
(ITB) in Berlin, Germany 
on Friday.

Heads of delegations 
from the three EAC nations 
that are part of a tripar-
tite agreement praised the 
move on the visa, launched 
three weeks ago by Pres-
idents Uhuru Kenyatta of 
Kenya, Paul Kagame of 
Rwanda and Yoweri Mu-
seveni of Uganda as a bold 
move that will boost re-
gional integration and ease 
the movement of tourists 
across the region.

Kenya’s Cabinet 
Secretary for East Africa 
Affairs, Commerce and 
Tourism Phyllis Kandie 

Sam Rainsy (L, upper), leader of the opposition Cambodia National Rescue Party, 
and his deputy Kem Sokha (R, upper) appear at a rally near the Freedom Park in 

Phnom Penh, Cambodia, on 8 March, 2014. Hundreds of opposition-aligned trade 
union activists and workers illegally rallied on a street near the capital’s Freedom 

Park on Saturday morning, calling for higher wages and release of 21 detained 
protesters.—Xinhua

said whereas in the past 
tourists visiting the three 
countries had to seek sepa-
rate visas in a cumbersome 
and costly process, all they 
needed now was to acquire 
one visa at 100 US dollars 
and visit the three states as 
many times as they wished 
for three months.

“This will harmonize 
immigration procedures, 
help curb cross- border 
insecurity, enable tourists 
have a one-stop border 
check point and generally 
open the region for more 
visitors,” she said in a 
statement received in Nai-
robi on Saturday.

The lack of a regional 
common visa has been a 
major drawback towards 
marketing East Africa as a 
single tourist destination.

Foreign tour opera-
tors have complained of 
cumbersome immigration 
procedures at border entry 
points for those who wish 
to cover various circuits in 
East Africa.

In particular, the re-
quirement for tourists to 
disembark from Kenya 

tour vehicles to board the 
Tanzanian vehicles while 
crossing into Tanzania has 
been a major point of com-
plain by the international 
and local tour operators.

Kenya allows tour ve-
hicles from the East Africa 
Community (EAC) to oper-
ate in the country. Industry 
watchers say the common 
visa will ease travel ar-
rangements for those in-
tending to tour East Afri-
can attractions.

Previously, foreign 
tourists visiting EAC coun-
tries are required to stamp 
their passports in each EAC 
country visited. The EAC 
is also in the final stages of 
implementing a single visa 
for the five member states.

The single tourist visa 
resulted from a joint initia-
tive and decision made by 
the Heads of State of the 
respective countries.

Before the establish-
ment of the single entry 
visa for Kenya was 50 dol-
lars, for Uganda was 50 
dollars and Rwanda was 30 
dollars.

Xinhua

Roadside bomb targets lawmaker’s 
car in E Afghanistan, wounds three
Jalalabad, (Afghani-

stan), 9 March — A road-
side bomb struck the vehi-
cle of a parliamentarian in 
the eastern Jalalabad city 
on Saturday, injuring three 
people including the law-
maker, a local official said.

“A bomb planted by 
militants on a road in Be-
hsoud District outside  

Nangarhar’s provincial 
capital Jalalabad struck 
the vehicle of member of 
parliament Abdul Ghafar, 
injuring him along with 
two of his bodyguards,” the 
official told Xinhua but de-
clined to be named.

Meanwhile, an of-
ficial with the press de-
partment of the provincial 

government in talks with 
Xinhua confirmed the in-
cident but did not give 
more details.

This is the second 
bomb blast in Jalalabad 
since Saturday morning. 
In the previous blast one 
person was killed and five 
others injured.

Xinhua

Radical rebels execute 10 
civilians in southern Syria

Damascus, 9 March — 
A radical rebel group exe-
cuted about 10 civilians in 
Syria’s southern province 
of Daraa, the official SANA 
news agency reported on 
Saturday.

The report cited on-
line video footage which 
showed that several armed 
masked men forced a group 
of civilians to kneel on the 
ground for execution. Ten 
people, including an elder-
ly man and a 10-year-old 
kid, were killed in a fusil-
lade of bullets fired at close 
range.

The elderly man 
begged for his life, while 
his executioner showed 
no pity to him but urged 
another masked militant 

to execute the 10-year-old 
boy. SANA said the mas-
sacre took place in Daraa, 
while activist reports said it 
was in a town in the north-
ern province of Aleppo and 
blamed the jihadist Islamic 
State of Iraq and the Levant 
(ISIL) for committed the 
killing.

The ISIL, imposing a 
radical Islamic rule in the 
areas under their control, 
have recently been engaged 
in fights against other radi-
cal groups across Syria.

The Syrian govern-
ment has for long ac-
cused regional countries 
of supporting such radical 
groups, which try to estab-
lish an Islamic state in Syr-
ia.—Xinhua

Thousands of women stage 
protests against gov’t,  

domestic violence in Istanbul
Istanbul, 9 March — 

More than 2,000 Turkish 
women staged anti-govern-
ment protests on the Interna-
tional Women’s Day in Is-
tanbul on Saturday evening. 
The demonstrators, mostly 
women, gathered in Istan-
bul’s busiest Istiklal street to 
protest the ruling Justice and 
Development Party’s (AKP) 
policies and any violence 
against women.

Around 50 members of 
an association against the 
women murder gathered on 
at Gezi Park’s entry facing 
Taksim Square, carrying 
banners denouncing do-
mestic violence. Riot police 
backed up with water can-
nons blocked all the way out 
to Taksim square cordoning 

off the square. The police 
used their shields to disperse 
the crowd.

The demonstrators 
shouted slogans against po-
lice brutality and against 
the government. The female 
protesters chanted “Police go 
home, the streets are ours,” 
“Tayyip (Turkey’s Prime 
Minister Recep Tayyip Er-
dogan) run away the wom-
en are coming.” The protest 
ended with minor quarrels 
between the two sides. Ac-
cording to a survey conduct-
ed by the Turkish Health 
Union, more than 79 percent 
of respondents believe there 
is gender inequality in Tur-
key that has caused poverty 
and disadvantages among 
women.—Xinhua

A man participates in an ox race known as “Kalavayal” at Kakkoor in Ernakulam 
District of India’s southern state Kerala, on 8 March, 2014.

Xinhua

Kidnapped 
Syrian nuns 

expected to be 
freed soon
Damascus, 9 March — 

Twelve Syrians nuns kid-
napped by Syria’s radical 
rebels earlier could possi-
bly be released as soon as 
on Sunday, local TV re-
ported.

The pan-Arab al-
Mayadeen TV said it has 
“information about a deal 
for today’s release of the 
kidnapped nuns of Maloula 
amid preparations for of-
ficial reception of them in 
Damascus.”

Radical jihadist mili-
tants earlier kidnapped the 
12 nuns from their convent 
in the Christian town of 
Maloula, north of Damas-
cus. The rebels took the 
nuns to the nearby town of 
Yabroud in December last 
year, where they have been 
fighting hard with the gov-
ernment troops recently.

Syrian forces have 
unleashed a wide-scale of-
fensive over the past three 
weeks to recapture the key 
town, where more than 
10,000 rebel fighters are 
believed to hide out.

As clashes are flaring 
up in the surrounding of 
Yabroud, media reports 
said communication with 
the kidnapped nuns had 
been cut off.

The rebels initially de-
manded the release of tens 
of their men in Syrian pris-
ons, but the recent military 
showdown has apparently 
forced them into accept-
ing an undisclosed deal to 
release the 12 nuns, whose 
kidnapping has unleashed 
a barrage of international 
condemnation.

Xinhua
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Indian airline Airbus catches fire 

after landing in Kathmandu
Kathmandu, 9 March 

— An Airbus 320 oper-
ated by an Indian airline 
with 182 people onboard 
caught fire after landing at 
Kathmandu airport on Sat-
urday, but no passengers 
or crew were injured, a top 
airport official said.

An IndiGo Airlines Airbus A320 aircraft is pictured parked at a gate at Mumbai’s 
Chhatrapathi Shivaji International Airport on 3 Feb, 2013.

Reuters

A rear landing gear 
of the IndiGo Air aircraft 
burst into flames after the 
plane taxied off the runway 
on Saturday afternoon, the 
airport’s general manager 
Rishikesh Sharma said in a 
statement.

Passengers were  

evacuated from the plane’s 
emergency exit and airport 
personnel doused the fire 
with extinguishers. One 
passenger sustained minor 
injuries.

The cause of the 
fire was not immediately 
known.—Kyodo News

Pakistan military says Afghan 
police fires 25 mortars

Davao City, (Philip-
pines), 9 March — At least 
four people were killed in a 
multiple-vehicle smashup 
along a road intersection in 
Southern Philippine city of 
Davao on Saturday after-
noon, local police said on 
Sunday.

Chief Inspector Jed 
Clamor, spokesperson for 
Southern Mindanao regional 
police, told Xinhua by text 
message that according to 
initial investigation, the ac-
cident occurred around 3:15 
pm on Saturday when doz-
ens of vehicles were stuck 
at the traffic snarl at an in-
tersection of the Davao-Co-
tabato road and the Ulas Di-
version Road in Davao. 

“A wayward cement 
mixer plowed into other ve-
hicles during a traffic jam,” 
said Clamor, adding that the 
cement mixer then went out 
of control and hit two other 
vehicles, including a ten-
wheel truck and a motorbike.

Clamor said massive 
impact killed three people—
the drivers of the cement 
mixer and the motorcar as 
well as a male motorcycle 
passenger —instantly. 

Xinhua

Mumbai, 9 March —
One worker was killed and 
two others injured in an 
accident on Saturday night 
at a site of an under- con-
struction nuclear submarine 
at Eastern Naval Command 
in Visakhapatnam of South 
India, news channel CNN-
IBN reported. The incident 
took place when the pres-
sure of the hydraulic tank 
of the Arihant class subma-
rine was being tested and 
the tank’s lid fell on the 
workers of the shipbuilding 
center, local media said.

Police sources said 

Kabul, 9 March — The revival of the historic Silk 
Road is very essential for greater connectivity between 
China and other countries in the region, Chinese am-
bassador to Afghanistan, Deng Xijun, said in an article 
published in an Afghan newspaper on Saturday.

In the article titled the Silk Road — From Past to 
the Future, published by the English newspaper Daily 
Outlook Afghanistan, Deng said the call of Chinese 
President Xi Jinping for the joint development of an 
“Economic Belt along the Silk Road” is the continuation 
and development of the spirit of the ancient Silk Road.

“The initiative, by linking Central Asia, South Asia 
and West Asia, will contribute to greater connectivity 
and complementarity across the sub-regions, bringing 
Pan-Asian and Euroasian regional cooperation to a new 
level,” Deng said.

The Silk Road has become all the more important 

Revive Silk Road to contribute to greater regional 
connectivity: Chinese ambassador

and precious as a symbol of peace, cooperation, open-
ness, inclusiveness, mutual learning and resilience, he 
stressed.

The ambassador pointed out, “the Belt initiative 
comes as a highlight in China’s diplomacy in the new 
era, especially its neighborhood diplomacy occupies the 
primary position in China’s overall diplomacy.”

“We hope to participate more actively in inter-
national affairs including those in the neighborhood 
through the ‘Belt’ initiative, highlighting the concept of 
amity, sincerity, mutual benefit and inclusiveness, pro-
viding more public goods and playing a more effective 
role as a responsible major country,” Deng said.

“Let us pool our wisdom and resources, work to-
gether to write a new chapter of the Silk Road and build 
a happy life for all of us, “ the ambassador concludes.

Xinhua

Four died 
in vehicle 

smashup in  
Philippines

One killed, two injured in accident at site of 
under-construction nuclear submarine in S India

Job seekers search for information during a job fair in Yinchuan, capital of northwest 
China’s Ningxia Hui Autonomous Region, on 8 March, 2014. During a job fair held 

here on Saturday, which marks the 104th International Women’s Day, more than 
7,000 out of nearly 10,000 positions are open specially for women.—Xinhua

24-year-old Amar was 
killed on the spot while 
Amzad Khan and Vishnu 
were seriously injured and 
admitted to a private hospi-
tal in the city.

The under-construc-
tion nuclear submarine was 
a follow-up of the Navy’s 
warship INS Arihant. Indi-
an Defence Research and 
Development Organization 
(DRDO) chief Avinash 
Chander has ordered an in-
quiry into the accident, ac-
cording to local media.

This accident comes 
just a day after a gas leak 

on an under-construction 
destroyer in Mumbai killed 
one Navy officer.

Two officers were 
killed on Wednesday last 
week when submarine INS 
Sindhuratna caught fire 
when being tested at sea.

Navy chief Admiral 
DK Joshi resigned last week 
due to a spate of navy acci-
dents in the last few months, 
including the blast that sank 
another submarine, INS 
Sindhurakshak, in August 
last year, killing all 18 sail-
ors and officers on board.

Xinhua

Islamabad, 9 March — Pakistan’s military said that 
Afghan security forces fired over two dozens mortars 
into its territory on Saturday, but no one was hurt. The 
latest incident occurred at a time when the execution of 
23 Pakistani security personnel by the Pakistani Taleban 
and the killing of 21 Afghan soldiers in Kunar Province 
increased diplomatic tensions between the uneasy 
neighbours.

Pakistan says that the Pakistani Taleban had 
executed the security men on the Afghan side of the 
border last month. Afghan officials said the Afghan 
Taleban who had attacked a border post and killed 21 
Afghan National Army troops had arrived from Pakistan. 
“Today morning between 0930-1125 hours, Afghan 
Border Police from Tarkhobi camp fired 25 mortars 
into Pakistan,” military sources said.  Tarkhobi camp is 
located in Afghanistan’s eastern Khost Province, which 
borders Pakistan’s North Waziristan.—Xinhua

Osaka, 9 March — Official campaigning began 
Sunday for an election to choose the next mayor of Osa-
ka City, with Toru Hashimoto seeking reelection and a 
fresh mandate for his signature policy of overhauling 
local administration, while major political parties have 
distanced themselves from the election.

Hashimoto, 44, surprised voters last month when he 
announced his resignation as Osaka mayor in the middle 
of his four-year term so that he can prove he has public 
support for his goal of creating an Osaka metropolitan 
government.

Hashimoto, co-head of the opposition Japan Resto-
ration Party, will be running in the race as a candidate of 
the local chapter of his party.

Other candidates running for the 23 March election 
are Mac Akasaka, a 65-year-old businessman and head 
of a political group, Toshihisa Fujishima, the 51-year-
old head of another political group and Shigeo Ninomi-
ya, a 37-year-old former temporary staff worker.

Major political parties, — the ruling Liberal 
Democratic Party and its coalition partner the New 
Komeito party, the main opposition Democratic Party of 
Japan, and the Japanese Communist Party have forgone 
fielding candidates in the election which they say lacks 
importance.

These parties are critical of Hashimoto’s move to 
hold an election again, calling it wasteful spending of 
taxpayers’ money.

Echoing such a view, a majority of voters in the 
western Japanese city questioned Hashimoto’s bid to 
seek re-election. According to a Kyodo News survey 
conducted in mid-February, 64.2 percent of 1,014 
respondents voiced doubts about his move, while 27.3 
percent welcomed it.

The lawyer-turned-politician aims to create an 
Osaka metropolitan area by merging the Osaka prefec-
tural and municipal governments in April 2015 but his 
initiative has hit a snag due to opposition from other 
political groups in the city.

Kyodo News

Campaign begins for Osaka 
mayoral race, Hashimoto seeks 

re-election
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INVITATION FOR OPEN TENDER
(16th Term Supply Tender)

1. Open Tenders are invited for the Myanma Petrochemical En-
terprise, the Ministry of Energy for the supply of High Speed 
Diesel 1.645 M bbls  ±10% and Jet A1 0.752 M bbls ±10%.

2. Tender Closing Date	 :	 2-4-2014 at (12:00) noon.
3. Tender Opening Date	 :	 2-4-2014 at (13:00) hrs,
4. Delivery Time	 :	 1st  April 2014 to 31st March 		

		  2015
5. Tender Documents and details information are available 

at the Department of Finance, Myanma Petrochemical 
Enterprise, Nay Pyi Taw, during office hours commencing 
13-3-2014 on payment of the Myanmar Kyat One Hundred 
Thousand (Kyat 100,000) per set.

6. Only bid from tenderer who has purchased tender document 
officially from Myanma Petrochemical Enterprise will be 
accepted for evaluation.

			   Managing Director
		  Myanma Petrochemical Enterprise

Invitation for Prequalification
(For Procurement of Cargo Handling 

Equipment)
1.	 The Government of Republic of the Union of My-

anmar has received a Loan from Japan International 
Cooperation Agency toward the cost of the Sub-Pro-
ject for Expansion of Yangon Port in Thilawa Area 
(Phase-I) under Infrastructure Development in 
Thilawa Area (Phase-I). It is intended that part of 
the proceeds of this Loan will be applied to eligible 
payments under the contract resulting from the bidding 
for which this prequalification is conducted.

2.	 The Myanma Port Authority intends to prequalify 
contractors and/or firms for procurement of the fol-
lowing plants: 

	 •	 STS (Ship-to-Shore) Gantry Crane: 2 units 
	 •	 RTG (Rubber Tyre Gantry): 6 units 
	 •	 Reach Stacker: 3 units 
	 •	 Tractor & Chassis: 6 units 
	 •	 Forklift (3.5ton-lift): 2 units	
3.	 It is expected that Invitation for Bids will be made 

in May.	
4.	 Prequalification will be conducted through proce-

dures in accordance with the applicable Guidelines 
for Procurement under Japanese ODA Loans, and is 
open to all Applicants from eligible source countries, 
as defined in the Loan Agreement.

5.	 Interested eligible Applicants may obtain further 
information from and inspect the Prequalification 
Documents at the office of Myanma Port Authority, 
No.10, Pansodan St. Kyauktada Township, Yangon, 
Myanmar from on March 10-13, 2014 during Office 
Hour from 9.-30 to 16.30.

6.	 A complete set of the Prequalification Documents 
may be purchased by interested Applicant(s) on the 
submission of a written Application to the address 
above and upon payment of a nonrefundable fee of 
USD 500.00.

7.	 Applications for prequalification should be submitted 
in sealed envelopes, delivered to the address above by 
April 23, 2014 and be clearly marked “Application to 
Prequalify for the Package 2: Procurement of Cargo 
Handling Equipment, Sub-Project for Expansion of 
Yangon Port in Thilawa Area (Phase-I) under Infra-
structure Development in Thilawa Area (Phase-1)”. 

U Kyaw Myint 
Managing Director, Myanma Port Authority 
No, 10. Pansodan St. Kyauktada Township, 
Yangon, Myanmar	
Facsimile number: 95-1-246781. 391355

China’s 2011-2015 green investment to hit 5 trillion yuan
Beijing, 9 March —  

China is expected to invest 
more than 5 trillion yuan 
(817 billion US dollars) in 
environmental protection 
during the 12th Five-year 
Plan period (2011-2015), 
an environmental protec-
tion official said on Satur-
day.

Chinese Vice Minister of Environmental Protection Wu 
Xiaoqing and other senior officials from the Ministry of 
Environmental Protection give a Press conference for 
the second session of China’s 12th National People’s 

Congress (NPC) on environment protection, in Beijing, 
capital of China, on 8 March, 2014.—Xinhua

The investment comes 
from the government, fi-
nancial institutions and 
enterprises and also in-
cludes social capital, said 
Wu Xiaoqing, vice minis-
ter of environmental pro-
tection, on the sidelines of 
the ongoing annual session 
of the National People’s  

Congress, China’s top leg-
islature.

China has been in-
creasing its spending on 
environmental protection 
steadily, with an invest-
ment of 602.6 billion yuan 
in 2011, 825.3 billion yuan 
in 2012 and an estimated 
sum of 1 trillion yuan in 

2013, he said.
The government’s in-

vestment in this area will 
increase substantially in 
2014 with the introduction 
of a water pollution pre-
vention and control action 
plan this year, according to 
Wu.

Xinhua

Iran receives 
2nd tranche of 
payment under 
interim nuclear 

deal
Teheran, 9 March — 

Iran received the second 
installment of previously 
frozen oil assets under an 
interim nuclear deal with 
world powers, local media 
reported on Saturday.

The new funds, 
amounting to 4.5 million 
US dollars, was transferred 
to the account of Iran’s 
Central Bank on Monday, 
reports said.

Under the nuclear deal 
reached in Geneva in late 
November last year, Iran 
is urged to freeze and scale 
back part of its nuclear pro-
gramme for a six-month 
period in exchange for a 
western sanction relief, in-
cluding a gradual release of 
Iran’s oil assets up to 4.2 
billion US dollars.

Under the agreement, 
the funds are scheduled to 
be paid out in eight trans-
fers which started with a 
550-million-dollar pay-
ment by Japan on 1 Feb-
ruary. The International 
Atomic Energy Agency 
has been tasked with mon-
itoring Iran’s nuclear de-
velopments. Its head, Yu-
kiya Amano, confirmed 
on Monday that Iran had 
made sufficient progress 
in implementing its com-
mitments in line with the 
schedule.

Xinhua

A worker of the Supreme Electoral Tribunal (TSE, for its Spanish acronym) of El 
Salvador, placed ballot boxes at the National Institute “General Francisco Me-

nendez”, ahead of the second round of the presidential election, in San Salvador, 
capital of El Salvador, on 8 March, 2014.—Xinhua

20 years of traditional Chinese 
medicine in Malta

Valletta, 9 March 
—With its 20 year anniver-
sary next month, Malta’s 
centre for traditional Chi-
nese medicine is enjoying 
increasing popularity, as 
an alternative medicine in 
Europe.

The Mediterranean 
Regional Centre for Tra-
ditional Chinese Medicine 
(TCM) in Paola treats up 
to 10,000 Maltese patients 
per year using the ancient 
treatment techniques of 
acupuncture, massage, and 
sometimes physical ther-
apy, the clinic’s director 
Wang Xiaolan told Xinhua.

The natural treatments, 
part of a holistic, functional 

approach to medical thera-
py, are effective on more 
than 50 types of complaints 
relating to aches and pains, 
internal organ disorders, 
like hyperthyroidism, skin 
problems and also weight 
gain, according to the clin-
ic fact sheet. The Maltese 
know the clinic by word of 
mouth, Wang said, because 
it’s been here for 20 years.

“They know our cen-
tre, they know TCM. The 
results are important — as 
long as the patients have 
good results, they will keep 
coming here. Now we are 
getting more and more pa-
tients,” she explained.

“It was marvelous. 

They’re amazing,” said 
John Felix, a 78-year-old 
patient suffering aches 
and pains, testifying to the 
success of the treatments. 
Long popular in East Asia, 
the strictly therapeutic 
TCM treatments, which 
unlike painkillers, have no 
side effects, are increasing-
ly in demand in the West 
recently, as an alternative 
to pill popping. In Malta’s 
neighbour Italy, some one 
in seven of the population 
of some 58 million have 
recently used some form 
of natural, alternative med-
icine, according to a Eu-
ropean research network, 
CAMbrella.—Xinhua

Uncontrolled groups kill, 
injure civilians in Sudan’s 

Darfur
Khartoum, 9 March 

—   Tens of civilians were 
killed and injured when 
“uncontrolled groups” at-
tacked the Saraf Omra area 
in Sudan’s North Darfur 
State, local media said on 
Sunday.

“The situations at the 
western and eastern parts 
of the State are very critical 
and necessitate the inter-
vention of the central gov-
ernment to provide urgent 
assistance to people affect-
ed by the fighting,” me-
dia quoted Osman Yousif 
Kibir, North Darfur State 
Governor, as saying. He 
added that “uncontrolled 
groups” have kept working 

to disturb security and sta-
bility at western localities 
of the state. A few days ago 
they targeted the Central 
Reserve Forces, and then 
attacked Saraf Omra.

But the governor refut-
ed a potential threat against 
El Fasher, the capital city 
of North Darfur State.

He also criticized the 
silence of the international 
community toward rebels’ 
crimes. “The international 
community is standing a 
side and looking at crimes 
of the rebels,” Kibir said, 
reiterating his govern-
ment’s ability to bring mat-
ters back to normal track.

Xinhua
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Bollywood’s top 10 women-oriented films in the past decade
Mumbai, 9 March 

— Considered to be a 
male-dominated industry, 
Bollywood sometimes cel-
ebrates woman power with 
aplomb. In the past dec-
ade, several such movies 
with power-packed female 
characters have come to 
the fore.

On the occasion of In-
ternational Women’s Day 
on Saturday, here’s a look 
at ten such movies:

Murder (2004): Dur-
ing the year when Dhoom 
defined the Hindi film 
heroine as the air-headed 
eye-candy, Mallika Shera-
wat came to the forefront 
as a horny wife cheating 
on her husband. The last 
time that a screen wife 
had an affair under her 
husband’s nose was when 
Mala Sinha took a shine to 
adultery in Gumrah. This 
was different. This was a 
lot more physical. Mallika 
didn’t mind taking off her 
clothes during sexual in-
tercourse. Women’s inner-
wear became as important 
as their inner thoughts.

Black (2005): Rani 
Mukerji’s proudest mo-
ment. As a deaf and mute 
girl who climbs over 
every mountain to reach 
her goal, Rani’s perfor-
mance in this Sanjay Leela 
Bhansali film was brave 

Vidya Balan in a still from Kahaani.

and inspirational. She 
swept the awards and made 
her name as an actress who 
can be relied on to excel in 
an author-backed role. Her 
personal association with 
the Yash Raj Films banner 
has cost Rani plum roles 
in outside productions. 
After a disastrous hero-
ine-oriented turn in Aiyya, 
she will again be seen in 
an author-backed role in 
Mardaani.

Water (2005): Deepa 
Mehta named her incan-
descent heroine Kalyani 
after the timeless Nutan 
in Bandini. And Lisa Ray 

as the new-age Kalyani in 
this tale of forbidden love 
between a widow and a so-
cial reformer did not let her 
namesake down.

The Namesake (2007): 
Aushima Ganguly strand-
ed in the US after her 
husband’s death shakes 
and weeps uncontrollably, 
that one sequence defined 
Tabu’s impressive abili-
ty to shoulder films with 
the aplomb that her aunt 
Shabana Azmi showed 
throughout the 1970s and 
1980s. Tabu had the mak-
ings of another Shabana. 
She ruined it with her smug 

laid back attitude. Her 
histrionics today seem 
outdated when pitched 
against Parineeti Chopra 
and Alia Bhatt’s zest for 
excellence.

Fashion (2008): 
Madhur Bhandarkar’s 
hard-hitting saga of a 
small town girl’s rise as a 
supermodel and then the 
tripping over drugs and 
the fall. This was Priyan-
ka Chopra’s career-best 
performance matched 
only by her brilliance in 
Barfi. She lives out the 
model’s dreams, night-
mares and ambitions with 

Why Vidya Balan thinks 
she could soon win an 

Oscar
Mumbai, 9 March —

Actress Vidya Balan said 
that she hopes to win an 
Oscar award.

“I have never thought 
of winning an Oscar. Rath-
er I never thought I would 
get the Padma Shri. I think 
God has been kind to me. 
I think getting Oscar award 
is not too far away,” Vidya, 
who is the Ambassador 
of the Indian Film Festi-
val of Melbourne Awards, 
said at a Press conference, 
where she also announced 
nominations for the award 
function, scheduled to take 
place from 1 May to 11 

Vidya also said that she has no plans to join politics.

May.
Vidya said she is hap-

py with the response her re-
cently released film Shaadi 
Ke Side Effects received.

“People enjoyed the 
film and it feels good. I 
hope the film makes a 
mark. Life has been kind 
to me. I am happy with the 
love and appreciation that I 
have been getting through-
out my career. I feel bless-
ed. I try to do diverse and 
different roles,” she said.

When asked if she 
plans to join politics, Vidya 
says she had no such plans. 

PTI

Jennifer Lawrence unchanged by 
fame, says Nicholas Hoult

Los Angeles, 9 March — Actor Nicholas Hoult feels fame has not 
changed his Oscar-winning partner Jennifer Lawrence.

The British star first, who started dating the American Hustle ac-
tress in 2011, said despite all the accolades she’s still the same person, 
reported Us magazine. “The privacy thing obviously changes but the 
rest pretty much stays the same. It’s like that thing whereby you don’t 
believe your own hype. Enjoy the good times, but don’t get swept away 
with it. And I think that’s something she’s capable of doing and that’s 
what makes her special, but yeah, it is very odd, and I am just kind of a 
bystander in many ways. It is well-deserved for her. I haven’t really seen 
any change in her,” he said.

Nicholas Hoult, 24, first met Jennifer Lawrence on the sets of 
X-Men: First Class in 2011 and after a break in early 2013 they got back 
together when they were filming forthcoming sequel X-Men: Days of 
Future Past, which he says was a great experience because it meant they 
were able to spend plenty of quality time together.—PTI

Nicholas and Jennifer have been dating since 2011.

Leonardo DiCaprio 
drops out of The 

Deep Blue Good-By
New Delhi, 9 March — The Wolf of 

Wall Street star Leonardo DiCaprio has 
dropped out of The Deep Blue Good-By.

The 39-year-old actor was due to star 
in the movie adaptation, but will now no 
longer take the leading role, reported Dig-
ital Spy.

The Deep Blue Good-By is based on 
the book by John D MacDonald. The story 
centres on Travis McGee, a beach person 
who gets into misadventures during his 
salvage consultant jobs.

The reason behind Leonardo not star-
ring in the film has not been disclosed yet.

Leonardo again missed out on a Best 
Actor prize at the Oscars, losing to Mat-
thew McConaughey and causing Twitter 
to trend “Poor Leo”.—PTI

The reason behind Leonardo not 
starring in the film has not been 

disclosed yet.—PTI

a conviction that scoffs at 
the artifice that defines the 
glamour world. Chopra 
was so hot in the film that 
she made her co-star Arjan 
Bajwa look like a lost kid 
in her presence.

That Girl In Yellow 
Boots (2011): Kalki Koech-
lin’s made-to-order role as 
a foreigner trying to eke out 
a decent living in Mumbai 
through underhand means 
in a massage parlour was a 
portrait of peril under pres-
sure. She seemed to not act 
at all. And boy, that is quite 
something.

Kahaani (2012): Now 
the kahaani can be told. 
Vidya Balan pretended to 
be pregnant all through this 
film. Her final denudation 
of the artificial baby bump 
at the end signified how far 
the heroine’s image had 
come in our film. In Ka-
haani, Vidya and Kolkata 
were the heroes. Bengali 
star Parambrata Chatterjee 
joked he was the heroine of 
Kahaani. Some years ago, 
Shilpa Shetty had played 
the ‘hero’ of Phir Milenge 
while Abhishek Bachchan 
and Salman Khan sporting-
ly stepped in to be cast op-
posite her. Times, they are 
a-changing. Sujoy Ghosh 
wrote Kahaani specially 
for Vidya and even named 
the protagonist after the ac-
tress.

English Vinglish 
(2012): Sridevi’s come-
back film, released during 
the same year as Vidya 
Balan’s Kahaani, featured 
the 50-year-old actress as 
a housewife on a journey 
of self-realization. Debu-
tant director Gauri Shinde 
was obviously a crazy Sri 
fan. That helped. Sadly, 
no other film since then 
has found place for Sride-
vi’s indomitable talent.

Heroine (2012): This 
film did not set the box 
office on fire as it was 
expected to, but Kareena 
Kapoor’s descent into a 
cocaine-sniffing nervous 
wreck of a movie star 
was stark, raw and mov-
ing. Too bad, director 
Bhandarkar seemed to be 
making “Fashion” all over 
again. Kareena, though, 
still has a lot to give to the 
camera.

Queen (2014): Rani 
gets jilted at the altar and 
decides to alter her life 
irreversibly. Kangana 
Ranaut’s interpretation of 
a girl’s journey through 
darkness into the light is 
so bouncy, bubbly and 
burnished that you want to 
stand up and applaud this 
film about a small-town 
Indian girl’s journey of 
self-realisation.

Yes, girl power lives 
on in our movies.

PTI
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Li, Federer win in Indian Wells, Nadal survives scare
Cary, (NC), 9 March 

— Top seed Rafa Nad-
al survived a scare from 
Radek Stepanek before 
winning his BNP Paribas 
Open second round match 
in three tight sets at Indi-
an Wells on Saturday. The 
Spaniard, in his first match 

as defending champion, 
was stretched to the limit 
before prevailing 2-6, 6-4, 
7-5 in night match that last-
ed two hours, 24 minutes in 
the California desert.

Nadal served eight 
double faults and was bro-
ken three times, but he 

also broke his Czech oppo-
nent three times, including 
twice in the final set. The 
pivotal moment came in 
the sixth game of the third 
set, when Nadal fended off 
three break points to hold 
serve. Earlier, Briton Andy 
Murray recorded his 300th 
hardcourt victory when he 
beat Stepanek’s compatriot 
Lukas Rosol in three sets.

Fifth seed Murray re-
covered from a slow start 
to beat his Czech oppo-
nent 4-6, 6-3, 6-2 as the 
top seeds took to the courts 
for the first time after re-
ceiving first round byes. 
“I got broken three times 
in a row the end of the 
first set, beginning of the 
second,” Murray told re-
porters. “I just kind of kept 
going and found a way to 
win, which is always the 
most important thing.”   

Only five active players 
have won more tour-level 
hardcourt matches, headed 
by Roger Federer (575). 
Seventh seed Federer 
dominated the first set but 
was taken to a tie-break 
in the second before pre-
vailing 6-2, 7-6(5) against 
French qualifier Paul-Hen-
ri Mathieu, while Swiss 
compatriot and Australian 
Open champion Stanislas 
Wawrinka clinched a 6-3, 
7-5 win over Croatia’s Ivo 
Karlovic. Australian Lley-
ton Hewitt failed to notch 
his 600th career win when 
he was beaten by South 
African Kevin Anderson 
7-6(5), 6-4.

The veteran Hewitt 
saved 10 of 11 break points 
but was unable to break the 
tall 17th seed’s powerful 
serve in the match.

 There was high drama 

in another match as Colom-
bian Alejandro Falla saved 
a match point at 5-2 down 
in the third set to beat Pol-
ish 18th seed Jerzy Janow-
icz 6-3, 2-6, 7-6(5). On the 
women’s side, top seed Li 
Na beat Chinese compatri-
ot Zheng Jie 6-1, 7-5. Aus-

Andy Murray (GBR) during his match against Lukas 
Rosol (CZE) during the BNP Paribas Open at the Indi-

an Wells Tennis Garden.—Reuters

tralian Open champion 
Li notched six breaks as 
Zheng struggled on serve. 
Defending champion Ma-
ria Sharapova made short 
work of her first match, 
beating German Julia Go-
erges 6-1, 6-4 in barely an 
hour.—Reuters

Rafael Nadal (ESP) reacts after winning his 2nd 
round match against Radek Stepanek (CZE) during 
the BNP Paribas Open at Indian Wells Tennis Gar-

den. Nadal won 2-6, 6-4, 7-5.— Reuters

Reed in Cadillac driver’s seat, Woods in hot pursuit
Doral, (Florida), 9 

March — American Pat-
rick Reed will take a two 
shot lead into the final 
round of the WGC-Cadil-
lac Championship while 
Tiger Woods stormed into 
contention with the lowest 
round of the tournament on 
Saturday. With the punish-
ing winds that created hav-
oc on Friday giving way to 
calm conditions, the Blue 
Monster course lost much 
of its bite allowing embold-
ened golfers to attack the 
pins.

Reed, who had a share 
of the four-way overnight 
lead, fired a three-under 69 
to secure a two-shot advan-
tage over compatriots Jason 
Dufner (68) and Hunter 
Mahan (71) into Sunday. 
The 23-year-old, however, 
might be looking a little fur-
ther down the leaderboard 
where Woods is one shot 
further back after a sizzling 
66 left the world number 
one well-placed to make 

a run at an unprecedented 
eighth WGC-Cadillac title. 
“That’s fine. I’ve seen Tiger 
a lot on the driving range,” 
said Reed, when asked how 
he would feel see Woods in 
his Sunday red shirt in front 
of him. “Never had the op-
portunity to play with him 
and I still haven’t been able 
to play with him.”

“But you know, when-
ever he’s close to the lead, 

he’s a guy you have to 
watch out for.” “At the 
same time, I have to go and 
just play my own game.” 
After a grueling second 
round described as a sur-
vival test, smiling players 
basked in nearly ideal con-
ditions on Saturday under a 
brilliant south Florida sun. 
While no golfer produced 
a round in the 60s on Fri-
day, nine did on Saturday 

with 27 breaking par com-
pared to three a day earlier. 
Woods was six behind the 
leaders when play began on 
Saturday before he mixed 
eight birdies with two bo-
geys to get to one-under for 
the tournament.

“It was nice to get back 
in the tournament again,” 
smiled Woods. “I held it 
together yesterday, a long 
day, a long, tough day and 
that gave me a chance to-
day. “I figured, hey, I’m 
only six back, that’s defi-
nitely do-able, especially 
with the conditions and how 
difficult this golf course is 
playing. “If I just get back 
to even par for the tourna-
ment, I’ll be right there and 
I did one better.” The 14-
time major winner carded 
birdies at the first and third 
and while he made bogey at 
the fourth, the world num-
ber one continued to claw 
his way up the board with 
two more birdies at five and 
nine.—Reuters

Patrick Reed tees off from the 5th hole during the third 
round of the WGC — Cadillac Championship golf 

tournament at TPC Blue Monster at Trump National 
Doral.— Reuters

Atletico leapfrog Barca and Real Madrid to temporarliy go 
top of Primera Liga

Madrid, 9 March —
Two goals from David Villa 
lifted Atletico Madrid to the 
top of the BBVA Primera 
Liga on Saturday night. Villa 
scored in the 62nd and 64th 
minute to give Atletico a 2-0 
win away to Celta Vigo and 
lift them above Real Madrid, 
who play at home to Levante 
on Sunday afternoon, on 
head to head goal difference. 
The game looked to be head-
ing for a draw between two 
well-matched sides, before 
Villa took advantage of a 
dreadful error from Celta left 

back Jony to open the scor-
ing with a low finish.

Celta were still reel-
ing two minutes later when 
Villa again found space on 
the edge of the Celta area to 
score his second of the night 
and make a case to go to this 
summer’ s World Cup after 
being left out of the Spain 
squad for Wednesday’ s 1-0 
win at home to Italy. Atleti-
co took advantage of Barce-
lona’ s disastrous 1-0 defeat 
to struggling Valladolid ear-
lier in the day to cause what 
is probably the biggest upset 

of the season to date in the 
Primera Liga.

Despite fielding his 
strongest possible side, Tata 
Martino was left frustrated 
as his side were never in the 
game against a rival who 
seemed to want to 
win more than the 
reigning champi-
ons. Fausto Rossi’ 
s 17th minute 
goal decided 
the game 
and al-
though  
 

Leo Messi and Neymar both 
had chances for Barca, the 
truth is Barca were second 
best and the result means 
the destiny of the league ti-
tle is not now in their hands 
even if they win in Madrid 

in two weeks. Getafe 
coach Luis Garcia is 

looking odds on to 
lose his job after his 

side were beaten 
2-0 away to 

bottom of 
the table 
B e t i s . 
Xinhua

Richard Kilty of Britain celebrates victory next to 
Jamaicans Nesta Carter and Kimmari Roach in the 
men’s 60 metres final at the world indoor athletics 

championships at the ERGO Arena in Sopot 
on 8 March, 2014.

Reuters

Briton Kilty steals 60 metres 
show in closest final

London, 9 March 
— Briton Richard Kilty 
shocked the favourites to 
win the tightest ever 60 me-
ters sprint final at the World 
Indoor Athletics Cham-
pionships on Saturday. “I 
told my dad four years ago 
that I’d be a world champi-
on and to think I’ve come 
out and done that, I feel like 
crying,” the 24-year-old 
Kilty told reporters.

Kilty took the gold 
medal in a personal best 
time of 6.49 seconds over-
coming American favorite 
Marvin Bracy and third-
placed Qatari Femi Oguno-
de. The eight finalists were 
separated by a mere 0.09 
seconds in the race at the 
Ergo Arena in Sopot, Po-
land.

Veteran fellow Brit-
on Dwain Chambers and 
Jamaican Nesta Carter, re-

spectively bronze and sil-
ver medalists at the cham-
pionships in Istanbul two 
years ago, were sixth and 
seventh. There was also 
a surprise winner in the 
women’s 60 meters hur-
dles with American Nia Ali 
beating Australian defend-
ing champion Sally Pear-
son to the line in a personal 
best 7.80 seconds. Britain’s 
Tiffany Porter was third.

“It wasn’t my night, 
but it was Nia’s and I have 
to congratulate her on a 
great performance,” Olym-
pic 100 meters hurdles 
champion Pearson said. 
“She was the best athlete 
out there and I have said 
all along that it isn’t about 
times, but instead about the 
athlete that can run the best 
race at the time and she did 
that.”

 Reuters
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(10-3-14 07:00am~  
11-3-14 07:00am) MST

(10-3-2014, Monday)

* 	Local News
* 	Tapestry; A Genuine 

Myanmar Handicraft
* 	World News
* 	Myanmar Traditional 

Art Bronze Casting
* 	Local News
* 	Food Trip (Ep-3)

(Part-1)
* 	World News
* 	In The Studio : L CO
* 	Local News 
* 	Journey To 

Unimaginable Spots 
(Ep-6)

* 	World News 
* 	Modifying Natural 

Thanakha Bark into 
Ready-Made Skin 
Care Product

* 	Local News
* 	Home Grown 

Treasure
* 	World News
* 	Making of Nawarat 

Rings
*	Local News
*	A Trip to Mon State 

“Mawlamyine”
*	World News
*	Myanmar Masterclass: 

3D
*	Local News
*	Crab Business (Part-

II) Soft Shell Crab
*	World News
*	Tea
*	Local News
*	A Short Trip To 

Upper Myanmar 
(Sagaing, Kawlin)

*	World News
*	Myanmar Railways 

City Circular Train
*	Local News
*	The Stories Of The 

Great Souls (Mar Mar 
Aye)(Ep-1)

*	World News
*	Image of the monks

6:00 am
1.	 Paritta By Hilly 

Region Missionary 
Sayadaw

6:30 am
2.	 Physical Exercise
7:00 am
3.	 News/Weather 

Report
8:30 am
4.	 Documentary 

(ASEAN)
9:30 am
5.	 Cartoon Series
10:00 am
6.	 News
11:15 am
7.	 Weekly 

Entertainment
12:00 pm
8.	 News/International 

News/Weather 
Report

2:35 pm
9.	 Documentary
3:00 pm
10.	 News
3:15 pm
11.	 Cute Little Dancer
4:15 pm
12.	 University of Distance 

Education (TV 
Lectures) Second 
Year (Chemistry)

5:00 pm
13.	 News
5:15 pm
14.	 Songs of Yester 	

	 Years
6:00 pm
15.	 News/Weather 	

	 Reoprt
6:20 pm
16.	 Documentary
7:00 pm
17.	 News
7:25 pm
18.	 TV Drama Series
8:35 pm
19.	 People Talks
8:45 pm
20.	 Hit Songs of Stars
9:00 pm
21.	 News
22.	 Documentary

Bayern Munich march on, Leverkusen drop points in German Bundesliga
Berlin, 9 March —

Bayern continue their re-
lentless run with a goal fes-
tival in the closing period 
at Wolfsburg meanwhile 
third placed Leverkusen 
share the spoils with Han-
nover at the 24th round of 
Bundesliga on Saturday. 
Bayern Munich carry on 
their title-march in the Bun-
desliga as they came from 
behind to crush resilient 
Wolfsburg 6-1. The “Ba-
varians” underline their ti-
tle-defence ambitions after 
their 16th consecutive win 
and a 23-point lead atop the 
standings.

The “Wolves” staged 
an auspicious start as Nal-
do headed home the open-
er at the far post following 
Kevin de Bruyne’s pin 

point cross at the 17th min-
ute. The deficit for Bayern 
seemed to be a wakening 
call for Pep Guaridiola’s 
men when Xherdan Shaqiri 
cancelled out the stunning 
opener by Wolfsburg nine 
minutes later. Bayern com-
pleted their comeback at 
the hour mark as Thomas 
Mueller made use of Thia-
go Alcantara’s through ball 
beating onrushing custodi-
an Diego Benaglio for the 
2-1 lead.

Wolfsburg seemed 
dazed, as Bayern were able 
to extend their lead with 
four goals within 17 min-
utes. Mario Mandzukic 
made it 3-1 on the score-
boards with his volley shot 
from 13 meters into the 
bottom right at the 66th 

minute. Frenchmen Franck 
Ribery added the fourth 
goal before Mueller and 
Mandzukic wrapped up 
their braces to inflict Wolfs-
burg the ninth loss of the 
season. Bayer Leverkusen 
stopped their losing streak 
of five matches although 
they wait for their first win 
since six games. However, 
the “Werkself” gave away a 
neat lead to share the spoils 
with Hannover following a 
1-1 draw.

Hannover nearly 
grabbed a perfect start but 
Leverkusen’s goalkeeper 
Bernd Leno denied Sza-
bolcs Huszti’s foul play 
penalty at the 5th min-
ute. Leno already denied 
five penalties this season. 
Leverkusen took the lead 

at the half-hour mark when 
Gonzalo Castro’s deflected 
effort overcame Hannover’ 
s goalie Ron Robert Zieler. 
Nonetheless Leverkusen 
were unable to put the re-
sult beyond doubt as Han-
nover responded minutes 
later through Artjoms Rud-
nevs, whose hammer beat 
Leno into the top left cor-
ner. Both sides remain on 
their positions, Leverkus-
en stay on third place with 
44 points while Hannover  

occupy 11th place with 26 
points.

Schalke recover from 
two heavy defeats as Klaas 
Jan Huntelaar helped his 
side with a hat rick to 
beat Hoffenheim 4-0. The 
Dutchman ensured a bright 
start for the “Royal Blues” 
when he broke the deadlock 
with just six minutes into 
the game. Huntelaar made it 
two following a successful 
fast break at the 28th min-
ute, beating Hoffenheim’ s 
goalkeeper Koen Casteels 
from 16 meters into the bot-
tom right. Huntelaar took 
the liberty to squander one 
penalty when he tried to 
beat Casteels, who denied 
the Dutchman with a save 
four minutes later. Hoffen-
heim pressed to reduce the 

arrear but instead Schal-
ke got their third when 
Chinedu Obasi exploited 
a square pass by Kevin 
Prince Boateng ten minutes 
into the second half.

The third goal took the 
wind out of Hoffenheim’s 
sails, as Huntelaar was 
not done with the scoring 
when he completed his hat 
trick and the 4-0 win at the 
79th minute. Elsewhere, 
Monchengladbach still wait 
for their first win in 2014 as 
Lucien Favre’s men lost 2-1 
to Augsburg that maintain 
in the hunt of a berth in Eu-
rope.Stuttgart stopped their 
eight-game losing streak 
as the “VfB” shared points 
with bottom side Braun-
schweig following a two all 
draw.—Xinhua

Anti-nuclear protesters march in Taipei on 8 March, 2014, ahead of the third 
anniversary of the Fukushima Daiichi nuclear plant disaster in Japan following a 

monster earthquake and tsunami on 11 March, 2011.—Kyodo News

Anti-nuclear 
protests held in 
Taiwan ahead 
of Fukushima 
anniversary

Taipei, 9 March — De-
fying rain and wintry chills, 
anti-nuclear activists in 
Taiwan staged island-wide 
protests on Saturday ahead 
of the third anniversary 
of the Fukushima Daiichi 
nuclear plant disaster in 
Japan following a monster 
earthquake and tsunami on 
11 March, 2011. Protesters 
staged marches in north-
ern, central, southern and 
eastern Taiwan, demanding 
that the government imme-
diately stop the construc-
tion of a fourth nuclear 
power plant located in the 
densely populated north of 
the island.

Organizers said more 
than 120,000 people took 
part in the island-wide 

protests, 70,000 in Taipei 
alone. Police estimated 

the turnout in the capital at 
22,000.—Kyodo News

Algeria, Mali to 
strengthen border 

security
Algiers, 9 March — Visiting Malian 

defence minister said on Saturday that his 
country hopes to strengthen the security 
cooperation with Algeria along their bor-
ders, which the latter closed earlier last 
year due to tensions in north Mali.

“We will revive our security cooper-
ation in border areas which had been sus-
pended by necessity because Mali could 
no longer control these regions,” Malian 
Defence Minister Soumeylou Boubeye 
Maiga said after meeting with Algerian 
Foreign Minister Ramtane Lamamra.

Maiga has requested Algeria to start 
exploratory talks in relation to the crisis in 
north Mali. He and his Algerian counter-
part signed a minute on military coopera-
tion between the countries.

But Lamamra evoked the issue of the 
abduction of Algerian diplomats in north 
Mali in April 2012. He said that the case 
was a matter of “constantly agenda” in 
Algerian-Malian discussions.—Xinhua

Liverpool police hunting down 
robbers targeting Chinese

London, 9 March — British 
police on Saturday said they are 
investigating a series of robber-
ies of homes of Chinese living in 
Liverpool that occurred during the 
past few weeks.

The Liverpool-based Mer-
seyside Police force’s Serious and 
Organized Crime Investigation 
Unit has been drafted in to inves-
tigate the raids in the city, home of 
Europe’s oldest Chinatown.

The police say they are work-
ing closely with the Chinese com-
munity to bring the culprits to jus-
tice.

So far the police are linking 
seven separate cash and jewellery 
raids that have taken place over the 
past few weeks.

Although none of the targets 
have been injured, gang members 
have threatened Chinese residents 
using iron bars and golf clubs as 
weapons.

The raids have all taken place 

at the homes of Chinese business 
people, mostly in various up-mar-
ket suburbs of Liverpool.

Police Superintendent Mark 
Wiggins of Merseyside Police said 
while no-one was physically at-
tacked the culprits turned up bran-
dishing golf clubs and iron bars to 
threaten homeowners.

“Being subjected to such an 
offence must be very frightening 
for the victims,” he said. “The 
force is taking a coordinated ap-
proach to investigating these in-
cidents and we are determined to 
trace those responsible.”

Police said a leaflet, with 
crime prevention advice, will also 
be made available to the Chinese 
community.

Each of the police force’s 
Area Commanders have been told 
about the robberies so patrols and 
high-visibility policing can be in-
creased where necessary.

Xinhua
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Government welcomes int’l, private sector cooperation 
to raise education standards Kyaw Thura (Nay Pyi Taw)

At the Education Re-
form Forum held from 
5- 6 March in Nay Pyi 
Taw, U Zaw Htay, Direc-
tor-General of the High-
er Education Department 
(Lower Myanmar) spoke 
out about the challenges 
faced to reform the ed-
ucation sector and for-
eign interest in invest-
ing. In an interview with 
Kyemon newspaper he 
said aspects focusing on 
national security and a 
comprehensive econom-
ic development should 
be taken into considera-
tion for the reform pro-
cess.

Kyemon: What steps 
will be taken to reform 
higher education?

U Zaw Htay: Neces-
sary measures will be taken 
to promote the national ed-
ucation standard. Curricu-
lum modification, academ-
ic and financial assistance 
for all-round development 
of infrastructure is planned.

Kyemon: We heard 
privatization will be al-
lowed in higher education. 
Please elaborate.

U Zaw Htay: It is true 
that privatization will be 
allowed at university level. 
Green light will be given 
to Myanmar businessmen 
to establish universities, 
but only through coopera-
tion with the government. 
Local businessmen can do 
joint ventures with foreign 
investors. 

Q: What are the rules 
and regulations for the es-
tablishment of foreign uni-
versities in Myanmar?

A: Foreign investors 
have to make investments 
first. They then have to fol-
low the investment law and 
education-related rules and 
regulations. 

Kyemon: What are 
the arrangements for pri-
vate schools?

U Zaw Htay: Private 
schools will be allowed and 
encouraged. We welcome 
cooperation with the pri-
vate sector in the education 
sector. Promotion of edu-
cation cannot be achieved 
by the government alone. 
Works being carried out by 
civil society organizations 

and private sector will be 
acknowledged after the for-
mulation of laws and poli-
cies. We recognize private 
sector cooperation. 

Q: How do you see the 
monastic schools?

A: They are important 
and necessary. The Myan-
mar education system is 
thought to have originated 
in these schools. Monastic 
schools play a key role in 
providing education to the 
children in remote areas. 
We have to discuss ways to 
assist those schools.

Q: When will we see 
success with the education 
reform?   

A: The education 
standard first has to reach 
ASEAN level, then we can 

discuss meeting interna-
tional levels. I hope ASE-
AN level higher education 
will be achieved in My-
anmar within two or three 
years. I believe our Myan-
mar students have a sense 
of creativity. They have 
fighting spirit. 

Most things are chang-
ing now. Reforms will 
range from pre-primary to 
tertiary education. Grad-
uates will have access to 
jobs. Autonomy will be 
given to universities. 

Q: Is there any inter-
national interest in Myan-
mar’s education sector?

A: Numerous coun-
tries have shown interest 
in the sector. Discussions 
with ASEAN members are 

underway. France, Ger-
many and Japan said they 
will set up training pro-
grams for Myanmar peo-
ple to be able to work in 
their enterprises here.

Trs: YM

Ducheeyadan Alal village fire started deliberately:
 eye witnesses

Yangon, 9 March—
Fires were reported in 
Ducheeyadan Alal vil-
lage in Maungtaw this 
morning, there were no 
casualties. According 
to eye witnesses, some 
villagers burnt their own 
houses.

The fire at about 10 
am which turned a small 
religious building and 12 
houses into ashes was 
put out on 11.45 am. Ac-
cording to eye witnesses 
from the same village 
Daw Halal Mahadu, 
aged 60, and Ma Hami-
da, aged 30, the fire was 
started by Sawdi Mulah, 
aged 42, son of U Maita, 
who set fire to his own 
house.

Local police led by 

Police Major Min Oo 
and Maungtaw District 
Police Force led by Po-
lice Inspector Thaung 
Tun rushed to the scene 
as the fire was reported.

The commanders of 
local police battalions, 
the deputy commission-
er, the district police 
force commander, the 
township administrator, 
the district law officer, 
the township police 
force commander, Hlut-
taw Representative U 
Aung Myo Min, Pres-
ident of Chamber of 
Commerce and Industry 
U Aung Myint Thein, 
the Ducheeyadan vil-
lage-tract administrator, 
officials and  the towns 
elders visited the scene 

and village clerk U Than 
Tun Oo and Oli served 
as the interpreter. Saw-
di Mulah is wanted by 

U Zaw Htay, Direc-
tor-General of Higher 
Education Department 

(Lower Myanmar)

at 2 pm. The grain silo of 
the accused was found to 
have been evacuated to a 
safe place before the fire 
broke out and his family 
members made no at-
tempt to put out the fire.

Ducheeyadan Alal 
village has a popula-
tion of 450 villagers. 
Some men hid during 
the day and returned to 
their homes at night. In 
this case, we have wit-
nesses who claimed the 
man named Sawdi Mu-
lah sprinkled his home 
with bottled gasoline 
and started the fire. The 
questioning of witnesses 
was done in the presence 
of village-tract adminis-
trator U Aung Zan Phyu 

the police in connection 
with the Police Sergeant 
Aung Kyaw Thein case. 
The fire caused the esti-

mated loss of more than 
K 640,000,” an official 
said.

MNA

Local authorities inspect the scene of fire in the Village of 
Ducheeyadan Alal in Maungtaw Township.—mna

Several houses in the Village of Ducheeyadan Alal in Maungtaw Township, Rakhine 
State, were completely destroyed by fire on 9 March, 2014.—mna


